
City	of	Bloomington	
Common	Council	

Legislative	Packet	

11	September	2013	

For	legislation	and	background	material	regarding	Ord	13‐11,	please	see	
the	28	August	2013:	Common	Council	Legislative	Packet.		

All	other	material	contained	herein.	

Office	of	the	Common	Council	
P.O.	Box	100	

401	North	Morton	Street	
Bloomington,	Indiana	47402	

812.349.3409	

council@bloomington.in.gov	
http://www.bloomington.in.gov/council	

https://bloomington.in.gov/media/media/application/pdf/15831.pdf


City of 
 Bloomington 

Indiana 

 City Hall 
401 N. Morton St. 
Post Office Box 100 
Bloomington, Indiana  47402 

 

 

 
 

  
Office of the Common Council 
(812) 349-3409 
Fax:  (812) 349-3570 
email:  council@bloomington.in.gov 

To: Council Members 
From: Council Office 
Re:      Weekly Packet Memo 
Date:   September 6, 2013 
 

 
 

Packet Related Material 
 
Memo 
Agenda 
Calendar 
Notices and Agendas: 
 None 
 
Legislation for Second Reading (Material in this Packet): 
 

o Revised Ord 13-11   To Amend Title 4 of the Bloomington Municipal Code 
Entitled “Business Licenses and Regulations” - Re: Chapter 4.04 (Business 
Licenses Generally - deleted); Chapter 4.18 (Pawnbrokers - revised); 
Chapter 4.20 (Secondhand Dealers - revised); Chapter 4.22 (Dealers in 
Valuable Metals - added); Chapter 4.24 (Taxicabs - revised); Chapter 4.28  
(Jitneys - deleted); and, Chapter 4.30 (Horse-Drawn Vehicles for Hire - 
deleted) 

Responses to Questions Raised at 28 August 2013 Committee of the 
Whole 

 Memo to Council from Patty Mulvihill, Assistant City 
Attorney 

 Exhibits A and B 
Amendments Offered by the Office of the Mayor for Consideration at the 
Rescheduled Regular Session on September 11th 

o Am 01 – Removing Fee for Taxicab Licenses (Inserting a new Section 
30 of the ordinance which amends Section 4. 24.100 Business license—
Term and fee)  

o Am 02 – Adding and Revising Exemptions to Secondhand Dealer 
Licenses (Replacing Section 9 of the ordinance which amends Section 
4.20.010 License – Required) 
 The changes would: 

  exempt businesses primarily engaged in transactions 
involving cd’s and lp’s; and  



 convert the threshold for exempting businesses with 
occasional transactions involving used goods from 15% of 
purchases in a year to $5,000 in any calendar year. 

o Am 03 – Changing Definition of “Pawnbroker” to Mirror State Law 
(Inserting a new Section 31 of the ordinance which amends Section 
4.18.010 – Definitions) 

o Am 04 – Changing the General Holding Period for Valuable Metal 
Dealers from 7 to 5 days, Correcting Definition of “Purchases” to 
Exclude Rather than Include Certain Transactions, and Correcting 
Section Numbers in the Table of Contents for this Chapter (Changing 
Section 15 of the ordinance which adds a new Chapter 4.22 entitled 
“Valuable Metal Dealers”) 
 The changes primarily: 

 refer to, or restate, the holding period and related 
exemptions set forth in IC 25-37.5-1-4 and 5; and 

 add a missing “not” between the words “does include” in 
the definition of “purchases” 

o Am 05 – Changing the Period for Pawnbrokers, Secondhand Dealers 
and Dealers in Valuable Metals to Report Certain Transactions from 
24 Hours to Two Business Days (Changing Sections 6, 13 and 15 of the 
ordinance which address “Information for the Police Department” for the 
aforementioned Businesses 

o Am 06 – Requiring Pawnbrokers to Copy a Customer’s Government 
Issued Photographic Identification Number Rather than a Driver’s 
License Number (Changing Section 6 or the ordinance which amends 
the newly renumbered Section 4.18.050 (Information for police 
department) 
 This change will allow a broader range of identification 

documents to be used during these business transactions. 
o Am 08 – Standardizing the Penalty and Revocation Provisions and 

Issuance Provisions ( Changing Sections 2, 4, 5, 14, 15 and 25 to, and 
adding a new section at the end of, the ordinance which affect Chapters 
4.18 (Pawnbrokers); 4.20 (Secondhand Dealers); 4.22 (Valuable Metal 
Dealers) and 4.24 (Taxicabs)  
 These  changes:  

 Provide the same penalties across the various chapters for 
operating without a license and failing to report 
transactions; 



 Clarify the bases for revocation of a license and apply those 
bases across the various chapters; and 

 Clarify that the Controller issues the license for one 
calendar year and keeps a record of those licenses.  

Amendments Sponsored by Council Members for Consideration at the 
Rescheduled Regular Session on September 11th 

o Am 07 – (Sponsored by Cm. Granger) - Creating a Gender-Neutral 
Ordinance (Inserting a new Section 32 of the ordinance which affects 
various provisions throughout Title 4). 
 These changes convert references to “he” and “his” to “he/ or she” 

and “his/her.” 
o Am 09 – (Sponsored by Cm. Volan) – Requiring a Warrant Before 

Police May Conduct General Search of a Person’s Name on the 
Online Database - Forthcoming 

 
Contact: 
 Patty Mulvihill at 349-3426 or mulvihip@bloomington.in.gov 
 Chief Diekhoff at 349-3310 or diekhofm@bloomington.in.gov 

 
Please see the weekly Council Legislative Packet issued for the 28 August 2013 
Regular Session and Committee of the Whole for the legislation (before it was 
revised), summary, and accompanying material. 

 
Legislation and Background Material for First Reading: 
 None 
 
Minutes from Regular Session: 
 

 August 28, 2012 
 
 
 
 
 
 

(Over) 
 
 
 
 

http://bloomington.in.gov/media/media/application/pdf/15831.pdf


Memo 
 

Reminder: Staff/Council Internal Work Session on Monday was Cancelled 
 

One Item Ready for Second Reading and No Items Ready for Introduction at 
the Rescheduled Regular Session to be Held on Wednesday, September 11th  

 
The Council will meet next Wednesday for a Regular Session (originally scheduled 
for September 3rd) and consider Ord 13-11 (Revisions to Title 4 of the BMC – 
Business Licenses and Regulations) under Second Reading.  As noted above, please 
see this packet for the: 

 Revised ordinance submitted on August 28th; 
 Memo to the Council with responses to questions raised at the last meeting 

including: 
o Exhibits A and B; and  

 Amendments 1 – 8 (Amendment 9 will be forthcoming) 
 
 



Monday,		 09	September	
5:00	 pm	 	Redevelopment	Commission,	McCloskey	
5:00	 pm	 	Utilities	Service	Board	–	Utilities,	600	E.	Miller	Dr.	
5:30	 pm	 	Plan	Commission,	Council	Chambers	

Tuesday,		 10	September	
4:00	 pm	 Bloomington	Community	Farmers’	Market,	between	6th	and	Madison	St	
4:30	 pm	 	Commission	on	Aging,	Hooker	Room	
5:30	 pm	 	Bloomington	Public	Transportation	Corporation	–	Public	Transportation	Center,	130	W.	Grimes	Ln.	
5:30	 pm	 	Board	of	Public	Works,	Council	Chambers	
6:00	 pm	 	City	of	Bloomington	Commission	on	Sustainability,	McCloskey	
6:30	 pm	 	Sister	Cities	International	–	Posoltega,	Kelly	Room	
6:30	 pm	 	Sister	Cities	International	–	CubAmistad,	Dunlap	Room	
7:30	 pm	 	Sister	Cities	International,	Kelly	Room	

Wednesday,		 11	September	
4:00	 pm	 	Arts	Commission	Grant	Workshop,	McCloskey	
5:00	 pm	 	Bloomington	Arts	Commission,	McCloskey	
5:30	 pm	 	Commission	on	the	Status	of	Black	Males,	Hooker	Room	
7:30	 pm	 	Common	Council	Regular	Session,	Council	Chambers	

Thursday,		 12	September	
12:00	 pm	 	Housing	Network,	Council	Chambers	
4:00	 pm	 	Monroe	County	Solid	Waste	Management	District	‐	Monroe	County	Courthouse,	Judge	Nat					

	U.	Hill,	III	Room	
4:30	 pm	 	Bloomington	Historic	Preservation	Commission,	McCloskey	
6:00	 pm	 	ImagineBloomington	Public	Input	Workshop,	Monroe	County	Public	Library	‐	Room	1C,	303	E.		

	Kirkwood	Avenue	

Friday,		 13	September	
1:30 pm  Metropolitan	Planning	Organization	Policy	Committee,	Council	Chambers	

Saturday,		 14	September	
8:00	 am	 	Bloomington	Community	Farmers’	Market,	Showers	Common	–	401	N.	Morton	
8:00	 am	 	A	Fair	of	the	Arts,	Showers	Plaza	–	401	N.	Morton	
12:00	 pm	 	Hispanic	Month	Kick‐Off,	Monroe	County	Public	Library	‐	303	E.		Kirkwood	Avenue	

City	of	Bloomington	
Office	of	the	Common	Council	

To							 			Council	Members	
From																Council	Office	
Re Weekly	Calendar	–	09	–	14	September	2013	

PPoosstteedd		aanndd		DDiissttrriibbuutteedd::		FFrriiddaayy,,		66				SSeepptteemmbbeerr				22001133		
	

401	N.	Morton	Street	•	Bloomington,	IN	47404	
City	Hall	

 

	

Phone:	(812)	349‐3409	•	Fax:	(812)	349‐3570	
www.bloomington.in.gov/council	
council@bloomington.in.gov 



NOTICE AND AGENDA 
BLOOMINGTON COMMON COUNCIL REGULAR SESSION  

7:30 P.M., WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 11, 2013 
COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

SHOWERS BUILDING, 401 N. MORTON ST. 
 

REGULAR SESSION 
 

  I. ROLL CALL 
 
 II. AGENDA SUMMATION 
 
III.      APPROVAL OF MINUTES FOR: August 28, 2013  Regular Session 
 
IV. REPORTS (A maximum of twenty minutes is set aside for each part of this 

section.)  
 1.  Councilmembers 
 2.  The Mayor and City Offices 
 3.  Council Committees 
 4. Public* 
 
  V. APPOINTMENTS TO BOARDS AND COMMISSIONS 
 
VI. LEGISLATION FOR SECOND READING AND RESOLUTIONS 

 
1. Ordinance 13-11 To Amend Title 4 of the Bloomington Municipal Code  
Entitled “Business Licenses and Regulations” - Re: Chapter 4.04 (Business Licenses Generally 
deleted); Chapter 4.18 (Pawnbrokers - revised); Chapter 4.20 (Secondhand Dealers - revised); 
Chapter 4.22 (Dealers in Valuable Metals - added); Chapter 4.24 (Taxicabs - revised); Chapter 
4.28  (Jitneys - deleted); and, Chapter 4.30 (Horse-Drawn Vehicles for Hire - deleted) 
 
  Recommendation:   Do Pass  0-0-8 
   Am 01-08:   Not Heard at Committee 
 

VII. LEGISLATION FOR FIRST READING 
 

None 
 

VIII. ADDITIONAL PUBLIC COMMENT* (A maximum of twenty-five minutes is set 
aside for this section.) 

  
IX. COUNCIL SCHEDULE 

 
 

X. ADJOURNMENT 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

* Members of the public may speak on matters of community concern not listed on the agenda at one of the two public 
comment opportunities.  Citizens may speak at one of these periods, but not both. Speakers are allowed five minutes; this 
time allotment may be reduced by the presiding officer if numerous people wish to speak. 

Posted & Distributed: Friday, 6 September, 2013 



ORDINANCE 13-11 

TO AMEND TITLE 4 OF THE BLOOMINGTON MUNICIPAL CODE  
ENTITLED “BUSINESS LICENSES AND REGULATIONS” 

- Re: Chapter 4.04 (Business Licenses Generally - deleted); Chapter 4.18 (Pawnbrokers - 
revised); Chapter 4.20 (Secondhand Dealers - revised); Chapter 4.22 (Dealers in Valuable 
Metals - added); Chapter 4.24 (Taxicabs - revised); Chapter 4.28  (Jitneys - deleted); and, 

Chapter 4.30 (Horse-Drawn Vehicles for Hire - deleted) 

WHEREAS, significant chapters of Title 4 of the Bloomington Municipal Code have not been 
updated in over twenty years, and a review of such has determined that Chapters 
4.04, 4.28 and 4.30 are no longer necessary and appropriate; and 

WHEREAS, theft and the commission of crime dictate that local law enforcement agencies 
aggressively search for stolen property in an effort to return property to the victims 
of those crimes; and  

WHEREAS,  despite the best efforts of local pawnbrokers, secondhand good dealers, and scrap 
metal dealers and their dedication to working with local law enforcement agencies 
to immediately identify stolen property, stolen property is occasionally and 
unwittingly transferred through these local businesses; and 

WHEREAS, because these three types of industries have outgrown the City’s current ability to 
effectively and efficiently identify criminal activity, an automated system is 
needed to allow law enforcement officials the opportunity to timely collect and 
share transaction information more efficiently; and 

WHEREAS, this automated system entails the electronic transfer of information regarding a 
purchase of goods, is necessary and appropriate, and is required by this ordinance; 
and 

WHEREAS, the Chapter regulating taxicabs has not been updated in over thirty years and minor 
changes are needed to the Chapter’s: insurance requirements, safety inspections, 
fees, revocation of license procedures;  

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY ORDAINED BY THE COMMON COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF BLOOMINGTON, MONROE COUNTY, INDIANA, THAT: 

Chapter 4.04 Business Licenses Generally 

SECTION 1.  Chapter 4.04, entitled Business Licenses Generally, shall be deleted in its entirety. 

Chapter 4.18 Pawnbrokers 

SECTION 2. Section 4.18.020(a) shall be amended by adding the following language to the end of 
this subsection:  “Applications shall include a copy of the following:  completed application for the 
State’s Pawn broking License submitted to the State’s Department of Financial Institutions; and State 
Pawn broking License.” 

SECTION 3.  Section 4.18.030 (License fees) shall be deleted in its entirety, all remaining sections 
shall be renumbered accordingly, and the table of contents at the beginning of this chapter shall be 
amended to reflect these changes. 

SECTION 4.  The newly renumbered Section 4.18.030(a) shall be amended by deleting the phrase “, 
or to comply with any ruling or requirements lawfully made pursuant to and within the authority of 
this chapter”. 

SECTION 5.  The newly renumbered Section 4.18.030(d) shall be amended by deleting the phrase 
“penalties imposed by Section 1.01.130” and by adding the following language to the end of this 
subsection: 



 

 2

(1) Operating as a pawnbroker without a license. 

First offense $240.00 

Second offense within any 12-month period $500.00 

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$1,000 

 

(2) Failure to provide complete reports to police department in a timely manner. 

First offense $50.00

Second offense within any 12-month period $100.00

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$250.00

 
SECTION 6.  The newly renumbered Section 4.18.050 (Information for police department) shall be 
amended by deleting the number “24” and replacing it with “48” as it appears in the first sentence, by 
deleing the words “social security number” and replacing them with the words “driver’s license 
number” and by further deleting the sentence “Information shall be collected at least once a week 
during normal business hours by the police department” and replacing it with the following:  
“Information shall be electronically transferred, within 48 hours of receiving said article, via a law 
enforcement website designated as an agent of the City of Bloomington Police Department for the 
sole purpose of collecting such records.  At no time shall the City of Bloomington Police Department 
designate an agent which shall charge the licensee any type of fee”. 
 
SECTION 7.  The newly renumbered Section 4.18.060 (Retention of acquired property) shall be 
amended by deleting the phrase “ten days” and replacing it with the phrase “seven days” and be 
further amended by deleting the phrase “card record required by this chapter is collected by the police 
department” and replacing it with “the property has been acquired by the pawnbroker”. 
 
  Chapter 4.20 Secondhand Dealers 
 
SECTION 8.  The Section headings under Chapter 4.20, entitled Secondhand Dealers, shall be 
amended so as to include the following two additional sections:  “4.20.060 – Information for police 
department” and “4.20.070 – Penalty”. 
 
SECTION 9.  Section 4.20.010 shall be amended so as to include the following additional language at 
the end of the section:  “No license shall be required if the person or corporation is primarily engaged 
in the business of buying, selling, trading or otherwise acquiring or purchasing one or more of the 
following:  clothes, cars, books, watercraft, or farm equipment.  No license is required for a garage 
sale, an estate sale, any sale that is held by a transient vendor and lasts no more than twenty-four (24) 
hours, or any sale held by either a charitable or political organization.  No license is required if the 
person or corporation only occasionally engages in the purchasing of used goods so long as this 
occasional business does not total more than fifteen (15) percent of the business’s purchases in any 
one year.  No license shall be required if the person or corporation is engaged in the business of 
operating a thrift store, consignment store, or antique store or mall.”  
 
SECTION 10.  Section 4.20.020 (License – Application – Fee – Issuance – Record) shall be amended 
be deleting the body of the provision and replacing it with the following: 
 

 The person or corporation described in Section 4.20.010 shall file a written application 
for a secondhand dealer’s license with the office of the City Controller.  Such license shall 
require the name of the applicant; if the applicant is a corporation, the name of the officer and 
their own personal address is required.  The place of business of the applicant shall also be 
stated.  Upon completion of the license application, a secondhand dealer’s license shall be 
issued to the applicant for that calendar year.  A record of such license shall be kept in the 
office of the city controller.  No fee shall be required to obtain this license. 
 

SECTION 11.  Section 4.20.030 (License – Display) shall be amended so as to delete the phrase 
“police officer of the city” and replace it with “law enforcement officer”.  



 

 3

 
 
SECTION 12.  Section 4.20.040 (License to be held twenty-four hours before sale) shall be amended 
so as to delete the phrase “twenty four hours” and replace it with “seven business days” wherever it 
appears in the section and the table of contents shall be amended to reflect the change in the title of 
the section.  
 
SECTION 13.  Chapter 4.20 shall be amended to add a new section entitled “4.20.060 – Information 
for police department” and it shall read as follows:  “All licensees under this chapter shall provide 
information for each article sold or received to the City of Bloomington Police Department within 48 
hours of receiving said article.  Such information shall include a description of the property, along 
with serial numbers or identifying marks, if any, and all of the following information on the seller:  
name, signature, address, date of birth, and government identification number.  Information shall be 
electronically transferred, within 48 hours of receiving said article, via a law enforcement website 
designated as an agent of the City of Bloomington Police Department for the sole purpose of 
collecting such records.  At no time shall the City of Bloomington Police Department designate an 
agent which shall charge the licensee any type of fee.”  
 
SECTION 14.  Chapter 4.20 shall be amended to add a new section entitled “4.20.070 – Penalty” and 
it shall read as follows:   
 
 “Any person who violates this chapter shall be subject to the following fines:  

(A) Operating as a secondhand dealer without a license. 

First offense $240.00 

Second offense within any 12-month period $500.00 

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$1,000 

 

(B) Failure to provide complete reports to police department in a timely manner. 

First offense $50.00

Second offense within any 12-month period $100.00

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$250.00

 
(C) In addition to the fines above, the Controller may refuse to license, suspend a license, or 

revoke a license, following a hearing in front of the Board of Public Works, to any business that 
violates the requirements of this chapter.” 
 
  Chapter 4.22  Dealers in Valuable Metals (New) 
 
SECTION 15.  A new chapter shall be added to Title 4 entitled “Chapter 4.22 Dealers in Valuable 
Metals” which shall be listed as such in the Table of Contents for that title and shall read as follows:  
 

“Chapter 4.22 Dealers in Valuable Metals 
 
 Sections: 
  4.22.010 – Definitions. 
  4.22.020 – Application for license. 
  4.22.040 – Penalties - Revocation of license. 
  4.22.050 – Books and records. 
  4.22.060 – Information for police department. 
  4.22.070 – Retention of acquired property. 
 
 
 



 

 4

 
 
4.22.010 – Definitions. 
 

(a) “Valuable metal” shall be defined as set forth in IC 25-37.5-1-1, as amended.  
 
(b) “Valuable metal dealer” means any person, partnership, association or corporation 

engaged in the business of purchasing and reselling valuable metal either at a 
permanently established place of business or in connection with a business of an 
itinerant nature, including junk shops, junk yards, junk stores, auto wreckers, scrap 
metal dealers or processors, salvage yards, collectors of or dealers in junk, and junk 
cars or trucks.  The term does not include a person who purchases a vehicle and 
obtains title to the vehicle.   

 
(c) “Purchase” means acquiring a valuable metal product for a consideration, but does 

include the following: 
 

(1) Purchases between scrap metal processing facilities as defined by IC 8-23-1-
36, as amended; or 

(2) Purchases from a business or corporation provided the consideration paid to 
the business or corporation is made payable directly to the business or 
corporation and not an individual.   

 
4.22.020 – Application for license. 
 

(a) No person, partnership, association or corporation shall engage or continue in business 
as a valuable metal dealer except as authorized by this chapter and without first 
obtaining a license from the City Controller.  Application for such license shall be in 
writing and shall state the full name and place of residence of the applicant, or if the 
applicant is a partnership, the full name and place of residence of each member 
thereof, or, if a corporation or association, the full name and place of residence of each 
officer thereof, together with the place or places where the business is conducted.   

 
(b) All applicants shall, as a condition for the granting of a license and on a portion of the 

application provided by the City Controller, agree that in the event the applicant as 
licensee receives merchandise of any kind which is stolen, he claims no right, title or 
interest in and to said merchandise, and that upon request by a law enforcement 
official having probable cause to believe that the merchandise is stolen, he will 
voluntarily surrender said merchandise to the possession of that law enforcement 
agency when given a receipt for the same. 

 
4.22.030 – Penalties - Revocation of license. 
 

(a) Any person, partnership, association, or corporation which violates any provision of 
this chapter, shall be subject to the following penalties: 

 
(1) Operating as a valuable metal dealer without a license. 

First offense $240.00 

Second offense within any 12-month period $500.00 

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$1,000 

 
(2) Failure to provide complete reports to police department in a timely manner. 
 

First offense $50.00

Second offense within any 12-month period $100.00

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$250.00



 

 5

 
 

(b)  In addition, the Controller’s Office shall, after notice and hearing by the Board of 
Public Works, revoke, by written order, any license issued hereunder if the Board finds that: 

 
(1) The licensee has failed to pay the annual license fee or to maintain in effect the 

bond or bonds required by Indiana Code 25-37.5 as amended, or to comply with any ruling or 
requirements lawfully made pursuant to and within the authority of this chapter; or 
 

(2) The licensee has violated any provision of this chapter or any rule or regulation 
lawfully made under and within the authority of this chapter; or 

 
(3) Any fact or condition exists which, if it had existed at the time of the original 

application for such license, clearly would have permitted the Controller’s Office to refuse 
originally to issue such license. 

 
4.22.040 – Books and records. 
 
 The licensee shall keep records of each valuable metal purchase on the form provided by the 
Indiana State Police as required by Indiana Code 25-37.5-1-2 as amended.  Additionally, each 
valuable metal dealer shall make and retain a copy of the government issued photographic 
identification used to identify the person from whom the valuable metal was purchased.  All such 
records shall be maintained by the licensee for two (2) years.  All such records shall be made 
available to any law enforcement officer upon request by said officer during normal business hours. 
 
4.22.050 – Information for police department. 
 
 In addition to the records required by this chapter, all licensees under this chapter shall 
provide information for each article purchased to the City of Bloomington Police Department within 
48 hours of purchasing said article.  Such information shall include the name of the person who sold 
the product to the valuable metal dealer and a description of the articles purchased.  Information shall 
be electronically transferred via a law enforcement website designated as an agent of the City of 
Bloomington Police Department for the sole purpose of collecting such records.  At no time shall the 
City of Bloomington Police Department designate an agent which shall charge a licensee any type of 
fee.  
 
4.22.060 – Retention of acquired property. 
 
 All property received by a licensee under this article shall be held intact by the licensee for at 
least seven days after the property has been acquired by the valuable metal dealer.” 
 
  Chapter 4.24 Taxicabs 
 
SECTION 16.  The section headings at the beginning of Chapter 4.24, entitled Taxicabs” shall be 
amended so that section 4.24.150 is entitled “Penalties - Revocation of License” instead of 
“Complaints” and so that sections 4.24.160 and 4.12.170 are deleted in their entirety. 
 
SECTION 17.  Section 4.24.010 (Definition) shall be amended by deleting the word “six” and 
replacing it with the word “eight (8)”.  
 
SECTION 18.  Section 4.24.040(d) shall be deleted in its entirety. 
 
SECTION 19.  Section 4.24.050 (Business license – Insurance required) shall be deleted in its 
entirety and replaced with the following:   
 

4.24.050 Business license—Insurance required.  
 

(a) It is unlawful for any person to operate a taxicab within the City of 
Bloomington unless at the time of such operation the owner has in effect a valid policy of 
commercial general liability coverage and a valid policy of automobile coverage on each of 
the vehicles used by the company.   Proof of insurance shall be provided by an applicant for a 
taxicab license at the time of application.  Applicant shall also provide the city with a 
municipal hold-harmless certificate. 



 

 6

 
 

 (b) The terms of the commercial general liability policy shall provide that the 
insurance company assumes financial responsibility in an amount not less than one million 
dollars per occurrence or two million dollars in the aggregate. 

 
 (c) A valid certificate of insurance issued by a company providing the required 
insurance policies shall be available for inspection at the owner’s principal place of business.  
A certificate of insurance shall provide that the insurer will immediately notify the controller 
of any cancellation of, or change in, the owner’s insurance policies and that such notice shall 
be in writing and shall be sent by registered mail at least thirty days before cancellation of the 
policy.  The certificate shall include all of the following: 
 

(1) The full name of the insurer; 
(2) The name and address of the insured; 
(3) The insurance policy number; 
(4) The type and limits of coverage; 
(5) The specific vehicles insured; 
(6) The effective dates of the insurance policy; and 
(7) The certificate issue date. 

 
(d) Proof of insurance shall include that the City of Bloomington shall be held 

harmless and included as an additional insured on said insurance.” 
 
SECTION 20.  Section 4.24.070(a) shall be amended by deleting the phrase “the chief of police or his 
designee has made a” and replacing it with “it has undergone an independent”, and be further 
amended by deleting the period after the word “application” and replacing it with the following:  
“within the last two years; a copy of the safety inspection shall be included with the application.”.  
This section shall be additionally amended by deleting the sentence: “The chief of police shall send a 
report of the inspection and his recommendation to the controller as soon as the inspection is 
completed.”   
 
SECTION 21.  Section 4.24.070 shall be further in amended in the following manner: 
 

(a) Section 4.24.070(b) shall be amended by deleting the phrase “been inspected by the 
chief of police or his designee” and replacing it with “undergone an independent safety inspection” 
and be further amended by adding the phrase “within the last two years” at the end of that provision. 

 
(b) Section 4.24.070 shall be further amended by adding part (c), which shall read as 

fellows: 
 
(c) If, at any time, the City of Bloomington has probable cause to believe that a 

taxicab is unsafe or in a mechanically unsound condition, the Chief of Police may order a 
taxicab licensed under this Chapter to undergo an immediate safety inspection.  The 
immediate safety inspection must occur within five business days and a copy of the safety 
inspection report shall be promptly submitted to the Chief of Police.  If the safety inspection 
reveals deficiencies with the taxicab, the taxicab can not be used until such time as the 
deficiencies have been remedied. 

 
SECTION 22.  Section 4.24.090(a)(3) shall be amended by adding the word “and” before “state” and 
by deleting the phrase “and city license plate number”. 
 
SECTION 23.  Section 4.24.090(a)(4) shall be amended by deleting the phrase “state requirements” 
and replacing it with “this Chapter’s requirements”. 
 
SECTION 24.  Section 4.24.090(b) shall be amended by adding the phrase “in accordance with 
Indiana law” after the word “destroyed”. 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 7

SECTION 25.  Section 4.24.150 (Complaints) shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the 
following:   
 

4.24.150 – Penalties - Revocation of license. 
 

(a) Any person, partnership, association, or corporation which violates any provision of 
this chapter, shall be subject to the following penalties: 

 
(1) Operating as a taxicab without a license. 

First offense $240.00 

Second offense within any 12-month period $500.00 

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$1,000 

 
(2) Failure to provide complete reports to police department in a timely manner. 
 

First offense $50.00

Second offense within any 12-month period $100.00

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$250.00

 
 

(b)  In addition, the Controller’s Office shall, after notice and hearing by the Board of 
Public Works, revoke, by written order, any license issued hereunder if the Board finds that: 

 
(1) The licensee has failed to pay the annual license fee or to maintain in effect the 

bond or bonds required by Indiana Code 25-37.5 as amended, or to comply with any ruling or 
requirements lawfully made pursuant to and within the authority of this chapter; or 
 

(2) The licensee has violated any provision of this chapter or any rule or regulation 
lawfully made under and within the authority of this chapter; or 

 
(3) Any fact or condition exists which, if it had existed at the time of the original 

application for such license, clearly would have permitted the Controller’s Office to refuse 
originally to issue such license. 

 
SECTION 26.  Section 4.24.160 (Suspension and revocation of license) shall be deleted in its 
entirety. 
 
SECTION 27.  Section 4.24.170 (Penalty) shall be deleted in its entirety. 
 
  Chapter 4.28  Jitneys 
 
SECTION 28.  Chapter 4.28, entitled Jitneys, shall be deleted in its entirety. 
 
  Chapter 4.30 Horse-Drawn Vehicles for Hire 
 
SECTION 29.  Chapter 4.30, entitled Horse-Draw Vehicles for Hire, shall be deleted in its entirety.  
 
SECTION 30.  If any sections, sentence or provision of this ordinance, or the application thereof to 
any person or circumstances shall be declared invalid, such invalidity shall not affect any of the other 
sections, sentences, provisions, or applications of this ordinance which can be given effect without 
the invalid provision or application, and to this end the provisions of this ordinance are declared to be 
severable. 
 
SECTION 31.  This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage by the 
Common Council of the City of Bloomington and approval of the Mayor. 
 



 

 8

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Common Council of the City of Bloomington, Monroe County, 
Indiana, upon this ______ day of ___________________, 2013. 
 
 
……………………………………………………….………...___________________________ 
 ……………………………………………………….………..DARRYL NEHER, President 
  ………………………………………………………………  Bloomington Common Council 
ATTEST: 
 
____________________ 
REGINA MOORE, Clerk 
City of Bloomington 
 
PRESENTED by me to the Mayor of the City of Bloomington, Monroe County, Indiana, upon this 
______ day of ______________________, 2013. 
 
 
_____________________ 
REGINA MOORE, Clerk 
City of Bloomington 
 
SIGNED and APPROVED by me upon this _______ day of ______________________, 2013. 
 
 
…………………………………………………………….…………________________________ 
…………………………………………………………….…………MARK KRUZAN, Mayor 
…………………………………………………………….………    City of Bloomington 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

SYNOPSIS 
 
This ordinance seeks to do four primary things.  First, it seeks to delete provisions and regulations of 
the Title 4 that are no longer necessary; particularly those chapters which require the licensing of the 
following:  carnivals; circuses; merry-go-rounds; museums; shooting galleries; skating rinks; 
theaters; pool tables; jitneys; and horse-drawn vehicles for hire.  Second, it seeks to update the 
chapter regulating taxicabs, since no update has occurred in the last thirty years, to do the following:  
increase the number of passengers a taxicab can carry from six to eight; require insurance in 
accordance with the City’s Risk Department’s established amounts; require the safety inspections of 
all taxicabs to be conducted by an independent inspector instead of the City’s Police Department; and 
establish a new procedure for the revocation of a license and new penalty provisions that are in line 
with other chapters of the City’s municipal code.  Third, it seeks to amend the chapters regulating 
pawnshops and secondhand dealers in three keys ways:  (1) eliminate the license fee; (2) establish a 
new procedure for the revocation of a license and new penalty provisions that are in line with other 
chapters of the City’s municipal code; and (3) require all such businesses to electronically transfer 
information regarding any item they purchased within 48 hours of said purchase via a law 
enforcement website designated as an agent of the City of Bloomington Police Department.  Fourth, 
it seeks to add a new chapter to the municipal code, Chapter 4.22, entitled Dealers in Valuable 
Metals. This new chapter will require all dealers in valuable metals to be licensed by the city and will 
further require said dealers to electronically transfer information regarding any item purchased within 
48 hours of the purchase via a law enforcement website designated as an agent of the City of 
Bloomington Police Department. 
 
 
 

 
(Over) 

 



 

 9

SYNOPSIS FOR REVISIONS  
 

Revisions were submitted after the ordinance was distributed in the Weekly Council Legislative 
Packet but before the legislation was introduced at the Regular Session on August 28th.  Here is a 
summary of those revisions: 

 
In response to concerns by community members, the business community and stakeholders, the City 
Administration has made four changes to its original proposal (said changes being found in this 
version).  First, the following types of transactions are now exempt from regulation in regards to 
valuable metal dealers:  (1) purchases between scrap metal processing facilities as defined by IC 8-
23-1-36, as amended; and (2) purchases from a business or corporation provided the consideration 
paid to the business or corporation is made payable directly to the business or corporation and not an 
individual.  Second, the definition of valuable metal dealer was slightly amended to allow for the 
possibility that the Indiana General Assembly could amend their definition and we would want to be 
consistent with any change so made.  Third, the insurance requirement section for taxicabs was 
amended to make it clear that taxicabs are to maintain two types of insurance:  (1) commercial 
general liability insurance; and (2) automobile insurance.  The commercial general liability insurance 
is to be at an amount of $1 million per occurrence and $2 million in the aggregate.  Fourth, the 
independent safety inspections on all taxicabs will be required to occur once every two years, instead 
of once every year.  Additionally, language was added which makes it clear that if the City believes a 
taxicab is unsafe or mechanically unsound the City has the right to call for an immediate safety 
inspection. 
 
 
 



 *** Amendment Form *** 
 
 
Ordinance #:  13-11 
 
Amendment #: 01   
 
Submitted By:  Office of the Mayor    
 
Date:   September 6, 2013   
 
Proposed Amendment: 
 
1. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by inserting a new Section 30 and renumbering the 
subsequent sections of the ordinance accordingly.  This new Section 30 shall read as follows: 
 
 

SECTION 30:  Section 4.24.100 (Business license—Term and fee) shall be amended so 
as to delete the sentence “The fee for a taxicab license shall be ten dollars and shall be 
paid to the city controller in the form of either cash or certified check.”  The Section 
heading and table of contents for this chapter shall be further amended so as to delete the 
words “and fee” as they appear in the heading of the section.   

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Synopsis 
 

This amendment deletes any fee requirement for a taxicab license.  The fee is being deleted 
because the City recognizes that taxi cab companies will face an increased administrative cost by 
the new requirement that each taxi cab undergo a vehicle safety inspection from an independent 
third party. 
 
 
 
8/28/13 Committee Action:  None 
9/11/13 Regular Session Action: Pending 
 
(September 6, 2013) 



 *** Amendment Form *** 
 
 
Ordinance #:  13-11 
 
Amendment #: 02   
 
Submitted By:  Office of the Mayor    
 
Date:   September 6, 2013   
 
Proposed Amendment: 
 
1. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by deleting Section 9 and replacing it with the following 
new Section 9. 
 

SECTION 9:  Section 4.20.010 shall be amended so as to include the following 
additional language at the end of the section:  “No license shall be required if the person 
or corporation is primarily engaged in the business of buying, selling, trading or 
otherwise acquiring or purchasing one or more of the following:  clothes, cars, books, 
watercraft, farm equipment, cd’s, or lp’s.  No license is required for any of the following: 
 garage sale; estate sale; any sale that is held by a transient vendor and lasts no more than 
twenty-four (24) hours; any sale held by either a charitable or political organization; 
persons or businesses which only occasionally engage in the purchase of used goods so 
long as this occasional business does not total more than five thousand dollars 
($5,000.00) worth of purchases in any one calendar year; thrift stores, consignment 
stores; or antique stores or malls.” 

 
 
 

Synopsis 
 

This amendment does two primary things.  First, it changes the exemption for businesses that 
only occasionally purchase used goods from a percentage basis to a dollar basis.  Businesses that 
purchase more than $5,000.00 worth of used goods in any one calendar year will be subject to 
the requirements of the Secondhand Dealer Chapter.  Second, it exempts businesses that primary 
purchase used cd’s and lp’s. 
 
 
 
8/28/13 Committee Action:  None 
9/11/13 Regular Session Action: Pending 
 
(September 6, 2013) 



 *** Amendment Form *** 
 
 
Ordinance #:  13-11 
 
Amendment #: 03   
 
Submitted By:  Office of the Mayor    
 
Date:   September 6, 2013   
 
Proposed Amendment: 
 
1. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by inserting a new Section 31 and renumbering the 
subsequent sections of the ordinance accordingly.  The new Section 31 shall read as follows: 
 

SECTION 31.  Section 4.18.010 (Definitions) shall be amended by deleting part (a) and 
replacing it with the following: 
 
(a) “Pawnbroker” shall be defined as set forth in IC 28-7-5-2 as amended.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Synopsis 
 

This amendment changes the definition of pawnbroker to mirror the definition in State law (I.C. 
28-7-5-2).  That definition currently reads:   
 

"Pawnbroker" means any person, partnership, association, limited liability company, or 
corporation lending money on the deposit or pledge of personal property, or who deals in 
the purchase of personal property on the condition of selling the property back again at a 
stipulated price, other than choses in action, securities, or printed evidence of 
indebtedness.” 

 
8/28/13 Committee Action:  None 
9/11/13 Regular Session Action: Pending 
 
(September 6, 2013) 



 *** Amendment Form *** 
 
 
Ordinance #:  13-11 
 
Amendment #: 04   
 
Submitted By:  Office of the Mayor    
 
Date:   September 6, 2013   
 
Proposed Amendment: 
 
1. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by amending Section 15 in the following manner: 
 

(a) The section headings for Chapter 4.22 (Dealers in Valuable Metals) shall be 
amended to renumber Sections 4.22.040 through 4.22.070 as Sections 4.22.030 through 
4.22.060 as indicated below:   
 
Sections: 

4.22.010—Definitions. 
4.22.020—Application for license. 
4.22.030—Penalties—Revocation of license. 
4.22.040—Books and records. 
4.22.050—Information for police department. 
4.22.060—Retention of acquired property. 

 
 
(b) Section 4.22.010 (Definitions),  part (c), shall be amended by inserting the word 
“not” after the word “does” and before the word “include” as they appear in the first two 
lines of that part. 
 
(c) Section 4.22.060—Retention of acquired property shall be deleted and replaced 
with the following:    
 

 Section 4.22.060—Retention of acquired property 
  

(a) In accordance with I.C. 25-37.5-1-4 a licensee under this article shall hold 
each purchase of valuable metal for at least five (5) days from the date of 
purchase at their regular place of business. 

 
(b) The five (5) day hold period noted in the above subsection (a) shall not 

apply to those purchases described in I.C. 25-37.5-1-5: 
(1) Purchases from persons, firms, limited liability companies, or 

corporations who are regularly engaged in the business of 
manufacturing valuable metals; 



(2) Purchases from persons, firms, limited liability companies, or 
corporations who are regularly engaged in the business of selling 
valuable metals at retail or in wholesale; 

(3) Purchases from one valuable metal dealer to another valuable 
metal dealer; and 

(4) Purchases from persons, firms, limited liability companies, or 
corporations who are regularly engaged in either the generation, 
transmission, or distribution of electric energy or in telephone, 
telegraph, and other communications if such persons, firms, 
limited liability companies, or corporations at the time of purchase 
provide the licensee with a bill of sale or other written evidence of 
title to the valuable metal. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Synopsis 
 

This amendment does two things.  First, it fixes a numbering error in the heading of the new 
Chapter 4.22.  Second, it corrects the definition of “purchase” to exempt rather than include 
certain transactions. Third, it modifies the mandatory hold period for valuable metal dealers.  
Instead of requiring the dealer to hold items for seven (7) days, the proposed amendment would 
require the same holding period as required by the Indiana Code, five (5) days—with some 
minor exceptions. 
 
 
8/28/13 Committee Action:  None 
9/11/13 Regular Session Action: Pending 
 
(September 6, 2013) 
 



 *** Amendment Form *** 
 
Ordinance #:  13-11 
Amendment #: 05   
Submitted By:  Office of the Mayor    
Date:   September 6, 2013   
 
Proposed Amendment: 
 
1. Ord 13-11 shall be amended in the following manner: 
 

(a) Section 6, which affects BMC Section 4.18.050 (Information for police 
department), shall be deleted and replaced with the following: 
 
SECTION 6.  The newly renumbered Section 4.18.050 (Information for police 
department) shall be amended by deleting the phrase “24 hours” and replacing it with the 
words “two business days” as it appears in the first sentence, by deleing the words “social 
security number” and replacing them with the words “driver’s license number” and by 
further deleting the sentence “Information shall be collected at least once a week during 
normal business hours by the police department” and replacing it with the following:  
“Information shall be electronically transferred, within two business days of receiving 
said article, via a law enforcement website designated as an agent of the City of 
Bloomington Police Department for the sole purpose of collecting such records.  At no 
time shall the City of Bloomington Police Department designate an agent which shall 
charge the licensee any type of fee”. 
 
(b) Section 13, which affects BMC Section 4.20.060 (Information for police 
department), shall be amended by deleting the phrase “48 hours” and replacing it with the 
words “two business days” wherever it appears in Section 13. 

 
(c) Section 15, which inserts a new Chapter 4.22 (Dealers in Valuable Metals) into 
Title 4, shall be amended in the following manner:  The phrase “48 hours” shall be 
replaced with the words “two business days” wherever it appears in Section 4.22.050 
(Information for police department).  

 
Synopsis 

 
This amendment changes the reporting requirement for pawnshops, secondhand dealers, and 
valuable metal dealers from forty-eight hours to two business days to better accommodate the 
business’s work periods. 
 
8/28/13 Committee Action:  None 
9/11/13 Regular Session Action: Pending 
 
(September 6, 2013) 



 *** Amendment Form *** 
 
 
Ordinance #:  13-11 
 
Amendment #: 06   
 
Submitted By:  Office of the Mayor    
 
Date:   September 6, 2013   
 
Proposed Amendment: 
 
1. Section 6 of Ord 13-11 shall be amended by deleting the words “drivers license number” 
replacing them with the words “government issued photographic identification number” 
wherever they appear in Section 6. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

Synopsis 
 

This amendment changes the requirement that a pawnshop write down the drivers license 
number of a customer to writing down the identification number of any government issued 
photographic identification card.  This will allow pawnshops to use military identification cards, 
state identification cards and passports. 
 
 
8/28/13 Committee Action:  None 
9/11/13 Regular Session Action: Pending 
 
(September 6, 2013) 



 *** Amendment Form *** 
 
Ordinance #:   13-11 
 
Amendment #:  07  
 
Submitted By:   Councilmember Granger, District 2   
 
Date:    August 28, 2013  
 
Proposed Amendment: 
 
1. Ordinance 13-11 shall be amended by inserting a new Section 32 and renumbering the 
subsequent sections of the ordinance accordingly.   This section makes changes in various 
chapters of Title 4 (Business Licenses and Regulations) to achieve gender-neutral pronouns.   
 

Miscellaneous Changes to Title 4(Business Licenses and Regulations) Including But 
Limited to Changes to Chapter 4.18 (Pawnbrokers), Chapter 4.20 (Secondhand Dealers), 
Chapter 4.22 (Dealers in Valuable Metals) & Chapter 4.24 (Taxicabs) 

 
SECTION 32. Title 4 (Business Licenses and Regulations) of the Bloomington Municipal Code 
shall be amended to change all references from “he” to “he/or she” and all references to “his” to 
“his/her” wherever they appear in this title to achieve gender-neutrality.   The amendments 
include the following and any others found by the codifiers in the course of making these 
changes to Title 4 of the Bloomington Municipal Code:   
 

(a) Section 4.18.010(b) shall be amended to delete the term “his” and replace it with 
the words “his/her” wherever it appears in this section; 

(b) Section 4.18.010(c) shall be amended to delete the term “he” and replace it with 
the phrase “he/or she” wherever it appears in the section; 

(c) Section 4.18.020(b) shall be amended to delete the term “he” and replace it with 
the phrase “he/or she” wherever it appears in this section; 

(d) Section 4.18.050 shall be amended to delete the term “his” and replace it with the 
words “his/her” wherever it appears in this section; 

(e) Section 4.20.030 shall be amended to delete the term “he” and replace it with the 
phrase “he/or she” wherever it appears in this section; 

(f) Section 4.22.020(b) shall be amended to delete the term “he” and replace it with 
the phrase “he/or she” wherever it appears in this section; 

(g) Section 4.24.030(b) shall be amended to delete the term “his” and replace it with 
the words “his/her” wherever it appears in this section; and 

(h) Section 4.24.070(a) shall be amended to delete the term “his” and replace it with 
the words “his/her” wherever it appears in this section. 

 
(Over) 

 
Synopsis 



 
This amendment is sponsored by Councilmember Granger and makes changes that create a 
gender-neutral ordinance.  In other words, errant references to “he” and “his” are changed to 
“he/or she” and “his/her” wherever they appear in Title 4.  
 
8/28/13 Committee Action:  None  
9/11/13 Regular Session Action: Pending 
 
September 4, 2013 



 *** Amendment Form *** 
 
 
Ordinance #:  13-11 
 
Amendment #: 08   
 
Submitted By:  Office of the Mayor    
 
Date:   September 6, 2013   
 
Proposed Amendment: 
 
1. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by amending Section 2.  Section 2 shall be amended so as to 
include the following additional language at the end of that section:   

 
“Upon completion of the license application, a pawnbroker license shall be issued to the 
applicant for that calendar year.  A record of such license shall be kept in the office of the 
city controller.” 

 
 
2. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by amending Section 4 to read as follows: 
 

SECTION 4. Section 4.18.040 (Revocation of license) shall be deleted in its entirety 
and replaced with the following and the change in heading shall be reflected in the table 
of contents of the chapter: 

 
 4.18.030  Penalties – Revocation of license 
 

(a) Any person, partnership, association, or corporation which violates any provision 
of this chapter, shall be subject to the following penalties: 

 
(1) Operating as a valuable metal dealer without a license. 
 

First offense $240.00 

Second offense within any 12-month period $500.00 

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$1,000 

 
(2) Failure to provide complete reports to police department in a timely manner. 

 

First offense $50.00 

Second offense within any 12-month period $100.00 



Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$250.00 

 
 

(b)  In addition, the Controller’s Office shall, after notice and hearing by the Board of 
Public Works, revoke, by written order, any license issued hereunder if the Board finds 
that: 
 

(1) The licensee has violated any provision of this chapter or any rule or 
regulation lawfully made under and within the authority of this chapter; or 
 
(2) The licensee is conducting the business licensed under this chapter in a 
manner contrary to State or local code; 
 
(3) Any fact or condition exists which, if it had existed at the time of the 
original application for such license, would have permitted the Controller’s Office 
to refuse originally to issue such license. 

 
3. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by deleting the substance of Section 5 and leaving it blank 
(in order to preserve subsequent numbering). 
 
 
4. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by amending Section 14.  Section 14 shall be deleted in its 
entirety and replaced with the following: 
 

SECTION 14. Chapter 4.20 shall be amended to add a new section entitle “4.20.070—
Penalties—Revocation of license” the heading of which shall be added to the table of 
contents of this chapter and the substance of which shall read as follows: 

 
 4.20.070  Penalties - Revocation 
 

(a) Any person, partnership, association, or corporation which violates any provision 
of this chapter, shall be subject to the following penalties: 

 
(1) Operating as a valuable metal dealer without a license. 
 

First offense $240.00 

Second offense within any 12-month period $500.00 

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$1,000 

 
(2) Failure to provide complete reports to police department in a timely manner. 

 

First offense $50.00 



Second offense within any 12-month period $100.00 

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$250.00 

 
 

(b)  In addition, the Controller’s Office shall, after notice and hearing by the Board of 
Public Works, revoke, by written order, any license issued hereunder if the Board finds 
that: 
 

(1) The licensee has violated any provision of this chapter or any rule or 
regulation lawfully made under and within the authority of this chapter; or 
 
(2) The licensee is conducting the business licensed under this chapter in a 
manner contrary to State or local code; 
 
(3) Any fact or condition exists which, if it had existed at the time of the 
original application for such license, would have permitted the Controller’s Office 
to refuse originally to issue such license. 

 
 

5. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by amending Section 15.  Section 15 adds a new chapter to 
Title 4 entitled “Chapter 4.22 Dealers in Valuable Metals”.  Section 4.22.020(a) shall be 
amended so as to include the following additional language at the end that section: 

 
“Upon completion of the license application, a valuable metal dealer license shall be 

issued to the applicant for that calendar year.  A record of such license shall be kept in the office 
of the city controller.” 
 
6. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by amending Section 25.  Section 25 shall be deleted and 
replaced with the following: 
 

SECTION 25.  Section 4.24.150 (Complaints) shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced 
with the following:   

 
4.24.150 – Penalties - Revocation of license. 

 
(a) Any person, partnership, association, or corporation which violates any provision 
of this chapter, shall be subject to the following penalties: 

 
 
 
 
 

(1) Operating as a valuable metal dealer without a license. 
 



First offense $240.00 

Second offense within any 12-month period $500.00 

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$1,000 

 
(2) Failure to provide complete reports to police department in a timely manner. 

 

First offense $50.00 

Second offense within any 12-month period $100.00 

Third offense, or thereafter, within any 12-month 
period 

$250.00 

 
 

(b)  In addition, the Controller’s Office shall, after notice and hearing by the Board of 
Public Works, revoke, by written order, any license issued hereunder if the Board finds 
that: 
 

(1) The licensee has violated any provision of this chapter or any rule or 
regulation lawfully made under and within the authority of this chapter; or 
 
(2) The licensee is conducting the business licensed under this chapter in a 
manner contrary to State or local code; 
 
(3) Any fact or condition exists which, if it had existed at the time of the 
original application for such license, would have permitted the Controller’s Office 
to refuse originally to issue such license. 

 
7. Ord 13-11 shall be amended by inserting a new section immediately prior to the 
severability section, with that section and subsequent sections numbered accordingly, and with 
that new section reading as follows:  
 
 “Section (?).  Section 4.24.080 (Business license – Issuance) part (a) shall be amended to 
add the following language at the end of that part: ‘A taxicab license shall be issued to the 
applicant for that calendar year and a record of such license shall be kept in the office of the city 
controller.’” 



 
Synopsis 

 
This does two main things.  First, it makes the penalty provisions of each the relevant chapters 
discussed in the Ordinance consistent with one another.  Second, it makes it clear when the 
Controller will issue business license for each of the relevant chapters discussed in the 
Ordinance. 
 
 
8/28/13 Committee Action:  None 
9/11/13 Regular Session Action: Pending 
 
(September 6, 2013) 
 
 



1 
 

MEMO: 

 
To: City of Bloomington Common Council 
From: Patty Mulvihill, Assistant City Attorney 
Date: September 6, 2013 
Re: Ordinance 13-11 
 
 
 During the October 28, 2013, City Council meeting several questions and issues were 

raised regarding proposed Ordinance 13-11. In an effort to address those questions and issues, 

the City’s Administration has prepared this Memorandum. Documents which staff believes will 

be helpful in better explaining the Administration’s answers and positions are attached to this 

Memorandum.  

 

Taxi Cabs: 

Issue: The owner of E2 Taxi asked that the ordinance be amended to clarify that the taxi 

fee is a fee per vehicle and not per business.  

Response: The Administration proposes an amendment, which deletes any fee requirement 

for a taxicab license. Taxicab companies may experience an increase in their 

administrative costs with the ordinance’s requirement that the companies receive 

vehicle safety inspections from independent third parties instead of from the 

Police Department. In recognition of this additional expense the Administration 

believes it appropriate to eliminate the license fee. This item is included in the 

weekly Council Packet as Amendment #1. 

 

 

 



2 
 

Secondhand Dealers: 

Issue 1: One of the owners of Tom Cats Pawn Shop asked that the ordinance be amended 

to include consignment stores and antique malls in the Secondhand Dealer 

Chapter because there have been several problems with stolen goods ending up in 

these locations. 

Response 1: The Administration does not believe regulation of consignment stores and antique 

stores is necessary for three reasons.  

a. First, stolen goods are not regularly sold to consignment stores and antique 

malls because the payoff is so delayed. When a person sells an item to a 

consignment store they are only paid when the item in question is 

purchased; most thieves desire an immediate payment of cash when 

selling stolen goods. 

b. Second, a review of the Police Department’s records and conversations 

with the Department’s lead detectives indicate that an insignificant amount 

of stolen materials are ever recovered from consignment stores or antique 

malls.  

c. Third, the fact that pawnshops and scrap metal dealers are so highly and 

closely regulated at both the State and Federal levels is indicative of the 

probability that stolen merchandise may end up, through no fault of the 

business owners, in these businesses; the lack of any such regulations of 

consignment stores and antique malls at the State and Federal level further 

solidifies the Police Department’s belief that regulation of these 

businesses is unwarranted. 



3 
 

 

Issue 2: The owner of Ace Pawn Shop asked that the ordinance be amended so as to 

specifically exempt Salvation Army and Goodwill. 

Response 2: While the ordinance does not specifically list the Salvation Army or Goodwill as 

exempted businesses, the ordinance does specifically exempt charitable 

organizations, which applies to both Salvation Army and Goodwill, and further 

exempts thrift stores, which also applies to both Salvation Army and Goodwill. 

The Administration does not believe any further specificity is required. 

 

Issue 3: The ordinance currently exempts from regulation under the Secondhand Dealer 

Chapter those businesses that only occasionally engage in the purchasing of used 

goods so long as this occasional business does not total more than fifteen percent 

of the business’s purchases in any one year. The owner of Ace Pawn Shop 

suggested that instead of using percentages as exemption, the ordinance should 

base the exemption off a dollar amount. 

Response 3: The administration agrees that a dollar amount exemption is more appropriate 

then a percentage amount exemption. To that end the Administration proposes 

amending the ordinance so that businesses that purchase less than $5,000 worth of 

used goods per calendar year are exempt from regulation. The Administration 

further believes it is appropriate to specifically exempt those businesses that 

purchase and sell used CDs and LPS. This item is included in the weekly Council 

Packet as Amendment #2. 

 



4 
 

 

Pawnshops: 

Issue 1: One of the owners of Tom Cats and at least one Council Member asked that the 

Administration better clarify whether or not the ordinance, in its current form, 

allows for a pawned item to be picked up by the original owner prior to the 

expiration of the seven day hold period. 

Response 1: Section 4.18.060 states that a “pledger may redeem pawned property at any time 

upon presentation of the pawn ticket and full satisfaction of the loan, interest, and 

storage fees as provided by Indiana Code 28-7-5”. The ordinance, as written, 

already allows pawned items to be returned to the person who pawned the item 

prior to the expiration of the seven-day hold period. 

 

Issue 2: An employee of Tom Cats Pawn Shop indicated that he would prefer that pawned 

items be exempt from the reporting requirements because pawning items is 

different than outright selling items and that it is a means for lower income 

individuals to obtain money. 

Response 2: There are two reasons why the Administration believes it is necessary for pawned 

items to be reported.  

a. First, the detectives who regularly investigate theft crimes indicate that 

customers of pawnshops regularly receive more money for a pawned item 

than they do for an outright sale. An example was given wherein a 

customer who sold a PlayStation 3 to a pawnshop may receive $50.00 for 

the sale, but if the gaming device was pawned the customer would instead 



5 
 

receive $75.00. If the customer is a thief who is ridding him/herself of 

stolen property then he/she would have no interest in ever collecting the 

pawned item, thereby it would make more sense for the thief to pawn the 

item then to sell it outright. The detectives with the Police Department 

have indicated that a significant amount of the criminals they have contact 

with are cognizant of the fact that pawning an item as opposed to outright 

selling it to a pawnshop is a more profitable venture.  

b. Second, by reporting all items sold and pawned by customers, the Police 

Department is able to review the information to look for patterns of 

behavior.  

 

Issue 3: One of the owners of Tom Cats asked for a clarification of the current definition 

of a “pawnbroker” and suggested that the definition be changed so as to eliminate 

the last few clauses. 

Response 3: As a matter of consistency, which slightly modifies the originally proposed 

definition of “Pawnbroker” in Ordinance 13-11, the Administration proposes to 

mirror the definition of “Pawnbroker” in Indiana Code 28-7-5, which has the 

following definition: "Pawnbroker" means any person, partnership, association, 

limited liability company, or corporation lending money on the deposit or pledge 

of personal property, or who deals in the purchase of personal property on the 

condition of selling the property back again at a stipulated price, other than choses 

in action, securities, or printed evidence of indebtedness. This item is included in 

the weekly Council Packet as Amendment #3. 



6 
 

  

Issue 4: The owner of Ace Pawn Shop indicated that once the Police Department seizes an 

item from his location, he loses any lien he has on that item. He asked that instead 

of allowing the Police Department to seize an item believed to be stolen, that the 

Department instead place a long-term hold on the item. 

Response 4: The overall purpose of Ordinance 13-11 is to better assist the victims of property 

crimes being made whole. If the Police Department is able to locate a person’s 

stolen property at a pawnshop, the Administration believes that property should 

be returned to its rightful owner as soon as legally permissible. Waiting to return 

the property to its rightful owner until a criminal case has been resolved could 

realistically delay the victim’s ability to obtain his/her rightful property up to 

eighteen months. While the Administration is cognizant that by returning the 

stolen merchandise to its rightful owner the pawnshop is at risk for losing money, 

the Administration believes the business has inherently acknowledged this as a 

risk of performing the type of business it performs, whereas the victims of crime 

have taken made no such affirmative action. 

 

Issue 5: Both pawnshops expressed concerns that by transmitting information to a law 

enforcement website they would be violating their customers’ privacy rights and 

possibly violating Indiana Code 28-7-5-39. 

Response 5: Indiana Code 28-7-5-39 states, the records created by pawnshops are confidential 

but subsection (b) states that these records may be obtained by law enforcement 

officials. This section of the Indiana Code does not prohibit law enforcement 



7 
 

officials from obtaining this information via a law enforcement website like Leads 

Online. Furthermore, Indiana Code 28-7-5-16 (f) contemplates and permits 

pawnshop owners to utilize third party vendors for the storage of their 

information. 

 

Valuable Metal Dealers: 

Issue 1: The representative for Bloomington Iron and Metal questioned the need to report 

every purchase made by valuable metal dealers. 

Response 1: The Administration has three responses to this statement.  

a. First, when the Administration originally drafted Ordinance 13-11 it did 

require every purchase made by a valuable metal dealer to be reported. 

But after conversations with such dealers, the Administration determined 

that two types of purchases would be excluded. The exclusions include, 

purchases between scrap metal processing facilities and purchases from a 

business, provided the consideration is paid directly to the business and 

not to an individual. 

b. Second, valuable metal theft is a significant problem and growing 

problem. Thieves steal both small and large quantities of valuable metal. 

Even minor amounts can add up to a considerable payday for criminals. If 

every record is not recorded the Police Department’s ability to track crime, 

monitor crime patterns and solve these types of thefts will be greatly 

reduced. 



8 
 

c. Third, the requirement that all types of transactions be recorded is 

consistent with what other cities and towns require of their valuable metal 

dealers. For example, this type of requirement can be found in the 

ordinances and statutes that regulate these types of dealers in:  State of 

Kentucky; Madison, Wisconsin; State of Pennsylvania (provided purchase 

exceeds $100.00); Columbus, Ohio; Indianapolis, Indiana; Lincoln, 

Nebraska; State of Minnesota; State of Mississippi; State of Alabama; 

Houston, Texas; South Bend, Indiana; and Fort Wayne, Indiana. Copies of 

the ordinances will be made available upon request. 

 

Issue 2: The representatives for both valuable metal dealers in Bloomington questioned 

the requirement that they hold all items purchased for at least seven days. They 

indicated that their facilities did not have appropriate storage facilities and that it 

could cause potential economic harm to their businesses. 

Response 2: The Administration has three responses. 

a. First, just because the item stolen may be considered scrap metal does not 

mean that its rightful owner does not want the metal returned to him or 

her. Compensating the victim with the value of the scrap metal may not 

actually be full compensation. The hold period allows the Police 

Department a minimal amount of time to attempt to locate the stolen 

property and return it to its rightful owner. 

b. Second, the Administration once again reviewed the Indiana Code 

regulating Valuable Metal Dealers and determined that it can agree to 



9 
 

reduce the hold period to five days so that the City of Bloomington’s hold 

requirement is consistent with the State’s hold requirement, said State 

requirement is located at Indiana Code 25-37.5-1-4, 5. This item is 

included in the weekly Council Packet as Amendment #4. 

c. Third, holding periods are consistently required by other jurisdictions. For 

example:  State of Indiana; State of Kentucky; Madison, Wisconsin; 

Lincoln, Nebraska; State of Mississippi; Houston, Texas; South Bend, 

Indiana; and Fort Wayne, Indiana. Copies of these ordinances will be 

provided upon request. 

 

Issue 3: The representative for Bloomington Iron and Metal suggested that valuable metal 

dealers should be treated differently than pawnshops and secondhand dealers 

because the natures of their businesses are grossly different. 

Response 3: While in theory the three businesses differ from one another they share one 

common factor: all three are highly susceptible to inadvertently receiving stolen 

property. In some ways, tracking stolen valuable metals is harder than tracking a 

stolen television; at least the television set has a serial number that can be tracked, 

while most valuable metals lack any such identification.  

 

Issue 4: The representative for Bloomington Iron and Metal suggested that since valuable 

metal dealers are already highly regulated at both the State and Federal levels, 

local regulation is unnecessary and burdensome. 



10 
 

Response 4: The Administration does not deny that valuable metal dealers are already highly 

regulated. They are highly regulated for a variety of reasons, one of which is the 

high probability the businesses will unwittingly find themselves in possession of 

stolen property. Despite all of the State and Federal regulations these entities are 

not required to transfer their purchase information in an electronic format to 

police departments in a set amount of time. The reporting requirement of 

Ordinance 13-11 is what is missing at the State and Federal level and it is this 

reporting requirement that has been proven in other jurisdictions to greatly 

increase law enforcements efforts in not only recovering stolen property but in 

prosecuting criminals. 

 

Issue 5: Council Members requested data and information on valuable metal thefts in the 

Monroe County area. 

Response 5: The Police Department’s Records Supervisor was able to pull some information 

regarding possible valuable metal thefts and two detectives were able to provide 

additional information. 

a. In the last two years the Bloomington Police Department and the Monroe 

County Sheriff’s Department have received at least 498 complaints of 

potential valuable metal thefts. 

b. Of these thefts, the detectives report that most of the stolen goods are 

never recovered. 

c. Detectives report that stolen items are recovered from valuable metal 

dealers, that the local dealers can be cooperative, but that at times, 



11 
 

suspicious activities and sales have been conducted with no reports being 

made to local law enforcement. 

 

Issue 6: The representative for Bloomington Iron and Metal suggested that instead of the 

mandatory reporting required by Ordinance 13-11 it would be more prudent to 

require the utilization of www.scraptheftaltert.com. 

Response 6: Detectives at the Police Department reviewed the aforementioned website and 

believe it will have no effect on their ability to solve crimes. The website is a 

website where victims of theft can report missing items. It is not a reporting 

mechanism for valuable metal dealers. In the last twelve months only 2 incidents 

have been placed on this website for the entire jurisdiction. Leads Online has a 

proven history of increasing the likelihood that victims recover their stolen items 

and that police officers solve theft crimes. 

 

Leads Online: 

Issue 1: Council Member Rollo asked if the Administration could provide any statistics on 

Leads Online’s usefulness in solving overall theft crimes. 

Response 1: The Administration spoke with Leads Online regarding this matter and 

unfortunately the company does not have any such statistics.  

 

Issue 2: Council Members asked if Leads Online would be able to attend the September 

11, 2013, council meeting. 



12 
 

Response 2: Because of the late notice and the fact that the company is based in Texas, a 

representative from the company is not able to attend the meeting. However, the 

company quickly answered all questions posed to administrative staff. 

 

Issue 3: Council Member Neher inquired as to the privacy standards and protections put in 

place by Leads Online to ensure that confidential information remains 

confidential. 

Response 3: Generally speaking Leads Online has strict privacy standards and uses high level 

protection devices to maintain its security. 

a. Leads Online uses a 128 bit encrypted site and uses the same time security 

features used by financial and medical institutions.  

b. The company regularly hires other companies to attempt to hack into their 

data servers to ensure that that the proper controls are in place, and to date no 

such hacks have been effective.  

c. There has been no breach of security at Leads Online in the last ten years.  

d. The company provided a summary of their security standards for review by 

this Council. The Security Overview is attached as Exhibit A. 

e. Furthermore, despite claims to the contrary, Leads Online does not sell any of 

the information it maintains to third parties; the only entities that have the 

ability to access the data are law enforcement agencies.  

f. Leads Online indicated that they have not been sued in any State, particularly 

in Florida and Texas, as alleged during public comment. A review of 

Westlaw, a legal database that allows attorneys to read cases filed in 



13 
 

jurisdictions across the country, did not reveal any lawsuits wherein Leads 

Online was a named party.  

g. Finally, all data transferred to Leads Online is stored indefinitely, it is not 

destroyed.  

 

Issue 4: Council Members asked about the BIM representative’s claim that Leads Online 

is a vendor-driven program wherein the company specifically solicited the Police 

Department. 

Response 4: Leads Online did not solicit the Police Department’s business. The Department 

has been aware of Leads Online for several years. Leads Online does attend police 

seminars and conferences but no representative made direct contact with the local 

Department.  

 

Issue 5: Council Members asked if the City had a contract with Leads Online. 

Response 5: Yes, the City does have a contract with Leads Online. With the addition of 

valuable metal dealers reporting, this contract will need to be amended. 

 

Issue 6: Some members of the public questioned whether or not the data transferred to 

Leads Online would become a public record. 

Response 6: Under the current ordinance the pawnshops and secondhand dealers are to provide 

the Police Department with information regarding items purchased and pawned. 

All of this information, minus information considered confidential by State law 

(for example, social security numbers), is already a public record and subject to 



14 
 

request and review by any person who files a request for public records. If the 

information is transferred to a law enforcement website like, Leads Online, the 

information would only be subject to the Indiana public records law if the Police 

Department downloaded the information and created a record of the information. 

Leads Online itself is not subject to the public records laws. 

 

Issue 7: Council Member Volan specifically asked for examples of where Leads Online 

was effective in solving crimes associated with valuable metal thefts. 

Response 7: Leads Online provided seven examples of where it was used to solve crimes 

associated with valuable metal thefts. These are only examples and are not meant 

to be exhaustive of the number of times it has assisted in successfully solving 

these types of crimes. Examples are attached as Exhibit B. 

 

Issue 8: Tom Cats indicated that a law professor had provided an opinion wherein it was 

alleged that the utilization of Leads Online was problematic under various federal 

laws (particularly the Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act) and the Constitution.  

Response 8: The Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act exempts investigations by local law enforcement 

agencies and further permits said agencies to utilize agents. Leads Online would 

be the authorized agent of the Bloomington Police Department, transferring 

information to said agent would not violate this federal regulation. Furthermore, 

the case cited by Tom Cats does not appear to be germane to the proposal at hand, 

it deals with drug interdiction check points. Courts such as the United States 

District Court for the Southern District of New York, the Michigan Court of 



15 
 

Appeals, and the United States District Court for the Northern District of Georgia 

have all held that pawnshops are closely regulated industries with no reasonable 

expectation of privacy such that the reporting to and inspection of their 

transaction records by local law enforcement are permissible under the 

Constitution. 

 

General Reporting:  

Issue 1: At least one Council Member wondered if it would be possible for the ordinance 

to require reporting of only certain items the Police Department feels are items, 

which are frequently stolen instead of requiring specific types of business to 

report. 

Response 1: There are at least two problems with this approach from the Administration’s 

perspective.  

a. First, listing items instead of businesses would require businesses where 

stolen goods are rarely, if ever, found to be licensed and to report their 

purchases. For example, jewelry is an item that is obviously regularly 

stolen. Consignment stores and thrift stores regularly purchase and sell 

jewelry; but stolen jewelry is rarely, if ever, located at a consignment store 

or thrift store. If we listed jewelry, the consignment store would have to be 

licensed and to conform to the reporting requirements, even though it is 

unlikely they would ever inadvertently be in the possession of stolen 

goods.      

b. Second, it is hard to determine or predict what will be considered valuable.      



16 
 

   For example, twenty years ago, CDs were regularly stolen and sold to     

   different types of businesses. Today, CD theft isn’t particularly problematic.  

 

Issue 2: Both pawnshop owners question the need to report their transactions to a third 

party instead of reporting the transactions directly to the Bloomington Police 

Department. 

Response 2: There are two reasons why the information needs to be reported to a third party 

instead of directly to the Police Department.  

a. The first reason is because it will be more efficient for police officers. 

Right now the pawnshops provide the police department with information 

regarding their transactions once a week, and the information is 

transmitted to them via a disk or paper copies. There is no way to collate 

this data. Instead, detectives have to read each transaction and try to 

remember if it is consistent with an item reported stolen. By having the 

businesses report their transactions to Leads Online this searching for a 

needle in a haystack ends. The computer does all of the collating for the 

detectives; instead of detectives spending hours trying to assimilate all of 

the information, Leads Online will assimilate the information almost 

instantaneously.  

b. Second, because Leads Online is a national database, it will allow law 

enforcement agencies across the country to better recovery stolen 

merchandise. During the first Council meeting a story was provided 



17 
 

wherein it was noted that 3 Rolex watches stolen in Greenwood were 

located in a Florida pawnshop because of Leads Online.  

 

Issue 3: One of the pawnshops questioned why anything other than a description of the 

item purchased or pawned needed to be submitted to Leads Online—they 

wondered why personal information regarding the seller also needed to be 

reported. 

Response 3: Information regarding the seller needs to be submitted for two reasons.  

a. First, by having the name and information of the seller available immediately, 

the police agencies will not have to then contact the businesses to obtain that 

information once they locate stolen goods. Instead, the police department can 

begin immediately trying to locate the seller.  

b. Second, by having the name and information of the sellers available, police 

departments will be better able to follow crime patterns and track criminals. 

For example, Leads Online was able to identify a person who has been selling 

fake jewelry across various states in the Midwest—this person conducted 179 

transactions since January 1, 2012, in twenty different states. If his name and 

information had not been transmitted to Leads Online, this pattern may never 

have been discovered. 

 

Issue 4: Concerns were raised by members of the public that reporting requirements such 

as those being proposed may cause the affected businesses to relocate to areas 

outside of the City limits if those areas did not contain similar ordinances. 



18 
 

Response 4: The Town of Ellettsville expects to introduce legislation, which mirrors the 

proposed Ordinance 13-11 in key aspects, either this coming Monday or two 

weeks from Monday. In the past, the Monroe County Sheriff’s Department has 

indicated a willingness to adopt ordinances regulating pawnshops and secondhand 

dealers upon the City’s adoption of the same.  

 

Issue 5: Multiple business owners indicated that the forty-eight hour reporting requirement 

was too cumbersome and would instead prefer that the reports be required to be 

made within two business days. 

Response 5: The Administration has reviewed the concerns of the relevant businesses and the 

needs of the Police Department and believes that modifying the ordinance to 

require reporting within two business days is appropriate. This item is included in 

the weekly Council Packet as Amendment #5. The Administration would note, 

however, that reporting requirements of less than two business days are common 

throughout other jurisdictions:  State of Kentucky (24 hours); Madison, 

Wisconsin (48 hours); Columbus, Ohio (by noon of each business day); State of 

Alabama (by close of business on date of transaction); Houston, Texas (daily); 

South Bend, Indiana (24 hours); and Fort Wayne, Indiana (24 hours). Copies of 

the ordinance will be provided upon request. 

 

Issue 6: Council Members were curious as to how the reporting requirements would affect 

the Police Department. 



19 
 

Response 6: The Police Department will be much more efficient in the use of its detectives’ 

time. If more work is created the type of work created will deal more with 

prosecuting thieves instead of trying to locate the thieves.  

 

Miscellaneous Issues: 

Issue 1: Council Members and business owners asked if instead of requiring a driver’s 

license from a seller if any form of governmental identification containing a 

picture could be used. 

Response 1: The Administration believes it is appropriate to modify the ordinance to make it 

clear that a driver’s license, a passport, a military identification card or any other 

lawfully issued governmental identification with a picture can be utilized by a 

seller.  This item is included in the weekly Council Packet as Amendment #6. 

 

Issue 2: Council Member Neher asked for an explanation of how State and local 

ordinances covering the issues in Ordinance 13-11 interact with one another. 

Response 2: The State of Indiana has statutes, which regulate pawnshops and valuable metal 

dealers; there are not state statutes, which regulate the business of secondhand 

dealers (although they are subject to some tax and financial restrictions). 

Generally speaking the requirements placed upon pawnshops and valuable metal 

dealers by local units of government add to the State’s requirements—these 

additions usually include specific reporting requirements, specific hold 

requirements, licensing fees, and specific penalty provisions for violating the local 

regulation. 



20 
 

Issue 3: Council Member Granger requested that Ordinance 13-11 be made gender 

neutral. 

Response 3: The Administration is in full agreement with request and understands that Council 

Attorney Dan Sherman has prepared an amendment at Council Member Granger’s 

request, an amendment that is supported by the Administration. This item is 

included in the weekly Council Packet as Amendment #7. 

 

Issue 4: Council Attorney Dan Sherman wanted to ensure consistency with the provisions 

of the different Chapters of this Ordinance. 

Response 4: The Administration has reviewed the proposed Ordinance and determined that the 

following changes should be made to ensure consistency throughout the different 

chapters. 

a. Change the title of 4.20.070 (Secondhand Dealers) to “Penalties—Revocation 

of License”; 

b. Reformat the penalty section of 4.20.070 so that it mirrors the format of other 

chapters; 

c. Add language about when the Controller issues a license to Chapters 4.18 

(Pawnbroker); 4.22 (Valuable Metal Dealer); and 4.24 (Taxicabs) for 

consistency with Chapter 4.20 (Secondhand Dealers). 

d. These items are included in the weekly Council Packet as Amendment #8. 















 

 

  
In the Council Chambers of the Showers City Hall on Wednesday, 
August 28, 2013 at 7:30 pm with Council President Darryl Neher 
presiding over a Regular Session of the Common Council. 
 

COMMON COUNCIL 
REGULAR SESSION 
August 28, 2013 
 

Roll Call:  Mayer, Rollo, Ruff, Sandberg, Volan, Granger,  Sturbaum, 
Neher, Spechler 

ROLL CALL 

Council President Neher gave the Agenda Summation  
 

AGENDA SUMMATION 

The minutes of Regular Sessions April 3, 2013, April 17, 2013, and July 
17, 2013 were approved by a voice vote.  
 

APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

 REPORTS 
Chris Sturbaum gave a report on the University Courts historic district 
that was platted on land owned by Moses Dunn in the early 1900s.  He 
gave some historic perspective on the area, the architectural styles, and 
noted the neighborhood’s designation on the National and State Register 
of Historic Places.  He said 410 N Park, 402 N Park, 803 E 8th St, 809 E 
8th St, 815 E 8th St, and 825 E 8th St were owned by Indiana University 
and had been recently swapped with the fraternity on 3rd Street so that 
IU could expand their law school and the fraternity could build a new 
structure in place of the properties noted instead of North Jordan 
Avenue where new ‘houses’ had been built for the past 60 years. He said 
that the properties would normally be reviewed if they were up for 
development, but because the properties were owned by IU there was no 
permission or review needed to tear down these buildings and build 
something else.  He said that IU’s interest trumped the City’s interest in 
this case, but there was a real question as to whether it was legal, right 
or fair for IU to demolish these houses that the fraternity would not be 
allowed to demolish and then give the land to the fraternity for their 
house.  He said the Historic Commission considered this issue as part of 
their mission to protect historic property in the City of Bloomington. He 
said they drafted a letter to the president and trustees, Foundation board 
of directors, and president of capital planning facilities to express the 
Commission’s opinion that the years of negotiating this deal should have 
been done in the open.  He encouraged people to speak against this land 
swap. 
 
Dorothy Granger said she participated in the Hoosier to Hoosier 
Community Sale the past weekend and called it a great opportunity for 
the community to resell usable items and divert 45 tons of items from 
going into the landfill. She said this effort raised $32,000 for the local 
Habitat for Humanity program and other sustainability programs.    
 
Tim Mayer congratulated the volunteers for the Second Annual Jazz 
Fest that took place the previous Saturday on Grant between Kirkwood 
and 6th Streets.  He said jazz was played from 11:00 am to 11:00 pm.  
He said it was a highlight of musical groups and an undertaking of huge 
proportions for an all-volunteer effort.   
 
Steve Volan noted that the Hoosier to Hoosier sale had grown 
enormously.  He said that he had attended the Makevention where 
people could display things they had made and encouraged others to do 
so too.  He said there were people building electronics, apparel and 
costumes among other things.  
Volan added his dismay at the University Courts situation. He noted the 
Collins Living Learning Center that was an IU residence but had been 
integrated into the neighborhood and fit with the character of the brick 
lined streets.  He said the university had overlooked  -- in redoing things 
on the campus by taking away a part of the City.  He called attention to 
the fact that IU had adopted their first campus master plan in 2010.  He 

 COUNCIL MEMBERS 



p. 2  Meeting Date: 8-28-13 
 

 

said the 160 page document had “Bloomington” mentioned a dozen 
times but no mention of the City’s Growth Policies Plan, and noted that 
IU didn’t engage the City in their desire for new building. 
 
Marty Spechler said he had approached a high official of IU about a 
compromise in this area, but the person had more important things to 
consider.  Spechler said that closed door sessions and decisions that 
concerned the public and even the University public were not new, and 
were unfortunate.   
Spechler noted that the day of this meeting was the 50th Anniversary of 
Dr. Martin Luther King, Jr.’s “I have a Dream” speech.  Spechler said 
the most important part of the speech was that King urged that people be 
considered irrespective of the color of their skin.  He said that for people 
Specher’s age it represented a change in psychology and emotional 
reaction. He said this was an important objective that the younger 
generation had made, but we still needed to take the opportunity to 
consider interactions with people who appear different. 
 
Ron Smith from the Commission on the Status of Children and Youth 
gave a report from the Commission.  He introduced members of the 
commission to the council and noted the mission being “to promote 
connections within our community which empower, enhance and 
nurture children and youth.”  He gave highlights of the commission’s 
activities since they first met in August of 2012 regarding developing 
mission, conducting a survey, sponsoring a conference, and providing 
support for projects and collaboration on the issue.  The council was 
also provided with brochures developed from this newest of the boards 
and commissions.  
 

 The MAYOR AND CITY 
OFFICES 

There were no reports from council committees at this meeting. 
 

 COUNCIL COMMITTEES 

Gabe Rivera spoke about ending the drug war in this county and 
country.  
 
Daniel McMullen spoke about the budget hearings held the previous 
week and the lack of public comment regarding the budget.  He said it 
wasn’t the City’s job to regulate and finance business. He said the City 
needed to reduce the number of department heads and give the power to 
businesses, not in the hand of politicians.  
 
Chaim Julian spoke about parking meters.  He said it was a golden 
opportunity for Bloomington Transit to begin a marketing campaign to 
promote using the bus. He said this was time to add additional routes 
and increase the frequency of the current routes for more convenient 
ridership. He said this would mitigate the impact of the parking meters.  
 
Glen Carter expressed despair at the contempt being shown to the 
chronically homeless who recently lost a relatively safe place to sleep.  
He said that aggressive panhandlers were scamming and were 
pretending to be homeless. He said that most of the chronically 
homeless were severely mentally ill and addicted.  AMA and other 
medical groups consider addictions to be a mental illness.  He said that 
these people risk seizure by abruptly stopping their use of drugs and 
alcohol, making it unsafe for them without detox help.  He pointed out 
what he called a double standard in town where groups of people being 
disruptive, violent, urinating in public and stumbling out of student bars 
juxtaposed with the less privileged people who might be doing the same 
thing. He said it was also a misconception that most of the homeless 
were from outside of Monroe County, saying that census data cannot 
prove that.  He said that the city and county are creating and 
perpetuating a problem by sweeping the homeless around with a giant 
broom.   

 PUBLIC 



Meeting Date: 8-28-13   p. 3 

 

 

There were no appointments to boards or commissions at this meeting APPOINTMENTS TO BOARDS 
AND COMMISSIONS 
 

There was no legislation for second reading at this meeting.  
 
 

LEGISLATION FOR SECOND 
READING AND RESOLUTIONS 
 

Ordinance 13-11 To Amend Title 4 of the Bloomington Municipal Code 
Entitled “Business Licenses and Regulations” - Re: Chapter 4.04 
(Business Licenses Generally deleted); Chapter 4.18 (Pawnbrokers - 
revised); Chapter 4.20 (Secondhand Dealers - revised); Chapter 4.22 
(Dealers in Valuable Metals - added); Chapter 4.24 (Taxicabs - revised); 
Chapter 4.28  (Jitneys - deleted); and, Chapter 4.30 (Horse-Drawn 
Vehicles for Hire - deleted) 
 
 

LEGISLATION FOR FIRST 
READING 
 
Ordinance 13-11 

There were no comments made at this segment of the meeting. 
 

PUBLIC COMMENT 

It was moved and seconded to cancel the Committee of The Whole 
meeting scheduled for September 11, 2013, and reschedule the Regular 
Session meeting scheduled for September 3, 2013 for a meeting on 
September 11th to effectively take extra time to consider Ordinance 13-
11. This motion completely eliminated the need for the council to meet 
on September 3, 2013. 
 
The motion was approved by a roll call of Ayes: 9, Nays: 0.  
 

COUNCIL SCHEDULE 
 

The meeting was adjourned at 8:28 pm.  
 

ADJOURNMENT 

APPROVE:                  ATTEST: 
 
 
 
 
Darryl Neher, PRESIDENT                  Regina Moore, CLERK 
Bloomington Common Council             City of Bloomington 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 


	Cover
	Calendar - 9-14 September 2013
	Agenda
	Ord 13-11
	Amendment 01
	Amendment 02
	Amendment 03
	Amendment 04
	Amendment 05
	Amendment 06
	Amendment 07
	Amendment 08
	Q&A
	Exhibit A
	Exhibit B
	Minutes: 8/28/2013



