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VENDOR YR - MAKE - MODEL BASE QUOTE OPTIONS MET SPECS SPEC #'S NOT MET
WARRANTY

MThs/Miles/Hrs
TOTAL W/ 

OPTS

Bloomington Ford
Clark Truck Body Quote

2017 Ford F250 4X4 $26,733.00

Dump Bed=$3,495
Bedliner=$456
Rust=$149
Plow=$4,671

Yes Basic =  36 /36k  
Pwrtrain=60/60k

$35,504

Bloomington Ford
Palfleet Truck Body Quote

2017 Ford F250 4X4 $27,506.00

Dump Bed=$3,445
Bedliner=$456
Rust=$149
Plow=$5,664

Yes Basic =  36 /36k  
Pwrtrain=60/60k

$37,220

Curry Buick 2017 Chevrolet Silverado 
HD 4WD

$29,941.07

Dump Bed=$5,695
Bedliner=$525
Rust=$508
Plow=$4,700

Yes Basic = 36 /36k 
Pwrtrain=60/100k

$41,369.07

Indiana State QPA 2017 Ford F250 4X4 $30,884.25

Dump Bed=$4,845
Bedliner=$795
Rust=$NA
Plow=$5,416.48

Yes
$41,940.73

(Rust protection 
not included)

Russ Dellen GMC

Uebelhor & Sons

VENDOR YR - MAKE - MODEL BASE QUOTE OPTIONS MET SPECS SPEC #'S NOT MET
WARRANTY

MThs/Miles/Hrs
TOTAL W/ 

OPTS
Bloomington Ford
Clark Truck - Knapheide 

2017 Ford F350 4X4 $56,915.15 Western 8" plow included
Rustproofing included

Yes Basic =  36 /36k  
Pwrtrain=60/60k

$56,915.15

Bloomington Ford
Palfleet Truck - Omaha

2017 Ford F350 4X4 $56,454.40 Western 8" plow = $1,112
Rustproofing included

Yes Basic =  36 /36k  
Pwrtrain=60/60k

$57,566.40

Curry Buick
2017 Chevrolet 3500 
Silverado HD 4WD

$56,913.70 Western 8" plow included
Rustproofing included

Yes Basic =  36 /36k  
Pwrtrain=60/60k

$56,913.70

Indiana State QPA 2017 Ford F350 4X4 $52,966.50 No Rustproofing Options
$52,966.50

(Rust protection 
not included)

Russ Dellen GMC

Uebelhor & Sons

VENDOR YR - MAKE - MODEL BASE QUOTE OPTIONS MET SPECS SPEC #'S NOT MET
WARRANTY

MThs/Miles/Hrs
TOTAL W/ 

OPTS

2016 E-One Stainless 
Steel Rescue Pumper

399,438.00$     None Requested No 8 = Brakes

Apparatus = 1 yr
Structural = 15 yr
Frame  = Lifetime
Paint = 10 yr

$399,438

2016 E-One Stainless 
Steel Rescue Pumper 
w/Disc Brakes

$400,428.00 None Requested Yes

Apparatus = 1 yr
Structural = 15 yr
Frame  = Lifetime
Paint = 10 yr

$400,428

Global Emergency Products 
(Pierce)

VENDOR YR - MAKE - MODEL BASE QUOTE OPTIONS MET SPECS SPEC #'S NOT MET
WARRANTY

MThs/Miles/Hrs
TOTAL W/ 

OPTS

Altech Industries Inc. 2017 ALTECH LR7-60 155,757.00$     

Hoses=$232
Chainsaw #1=$1,259
Chainsaw #2=$1,497
Boom Latch=$935
Platform Rotator=$8,811

No
12,37,45,50,
55

Chassis, body and 
equipment = 1 yr

$168,491

BID TABULATION ITB #2016-CON-001

3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCK WITH OPTIONS (828 - PARKS)

No Bid Submitted

No Bid Submitted

1 TON UTILITY TRUCK 4WD W/ PLOW (862 - PARKS)

No Bid Submitted

No Bid Submitted

FIRE PUMPER (334 - FIRE)

Fire Service Inc.

No Bid Submitted

AERIAL TRUCK W/CHIPPER BOX (848 - PARKS)

PHASE 1

No response from
Vendor
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BID TABULATION ITB #2016-CON-001
PHASE 1

Indy Aerial Equipment

VENDOR YR - MAKE - MODEL BASE QUOTE OPTIONS MET SPECS SPEC #'S NOT MET
WARRANTY

MThs/Miles/Hrs
TOTAL W/ 

OPTS
Contract Sweepers and 
Equipment

Best Equipment Inc.

Jack Doheny Co. 2016 Elgin Pelican NP $185,500 None Requested Yes 1 yr $185,500

 

VENDOR YR - MAKE - MODEL BASE QUOTE OPTIONS MET SPECS SPEC #'S NOT MET
WARRANTY

MThs/Miles/Hrs
TOTAL W/ 

OPTS
Contract Sweepers and 
Equipment

Best Equipment Inc. 2016 Tymco 600 $189,721
Liner for Hopper = $2,000
Pick-up Magnet = $750
In Cab Hopper Dump = Included

No

2,4,8,10,14,
14b,16,17,
17b,19,20,21,22, 
22b,24

1 yr $192,471

Jack Doheny Co. 2017 Elgin Crosswind $208,500.00
Liner for Hopper=$7,500
Pick-up Magnet=$700
In Cab Hopper Dump=$700

Yes 1 yr $217,400

VENDOR YR - MAKE - MODEL BASE QUOTE OPTIONS MET SPECS SPEC #'S NOT MET
WARRANTY

MThs/Miles/Hrs
TOTAL W/ 

OPTS

MacAllister Machinery

RPM Machinery 2016 Case 621F $160,000 None Requested No

1=Engine
2=Trans.
4=Axles
5=Loader
11-Hydraulics
12=Tank Cap.

36 MThs/3K Hrs $160,000

West Side Tractor 2016 John Deere 544K $163,700 None Requested Yes 24 MThs/2K Hrs $163,700

VENDOR YR - MAKE - MODEL BASE QUOTE OPTIONS MET SPECS SPEC #'S NOT MET
WARRANTY

MThs/Miles/Hrs
TOTAL W/ 

OPTS

MacAllister Machinery

RPM Machinery 2016 Case 580SN WT $105,000 Hydraulic Hammer=$9,500 No
1=Engine
5=Differential
11=Bucket

1 Yr Unlimited
Engine = 24 mths/2K 

hrs
$114,500

2016 John Deere 310 SL $95,200 Hydraulic Hammer=$13,600 No
1=Engine
9=Hydraulics
12=Backhoe

 1 Yr Unlimited $108,800

2016 JD 310 SL-HL** $102,300 Hydraulic Hammer=$13,600 Yes  1 Yr Unlimited $115,900

2016 JD 410L $107,700 Hydraulic Hammer=$13,600 Yes 1 Yr Unlimited $121,300

$1,349,236.70

TRUCK MOUNTED REGENATIVE AIR STREET SWEEPER (467 - STREET)

No Bid Submitted

No Bid Submitted

3 WHEEL MECHANICAL STREET SWEEPER (460 - STREET)

No Bid Submitted

No Bid Submitted

FRONT END LOADER (455 - STREET)

No Bid Submitted

BACKHOE LOADER (448 - STREET)

No Bid Submitted

West Side Tractor
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