
ORDINANCE 08-19 

TO AMEND TITLE 15 OF THE BLOOMINGTON MUNICIPAL CODE 
ENTITLED "VEHICLES AND TRAFFIC" 

WHEREAS, 

WHEREAS, 

the Traffic Commission has recommended certain changes be made in 
Title 15 of Bloomington Municipal Code entitled "Vehicles and 
Traffic"; and 

other changes to Title 15 are also necessary at this time; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY ORDAINED BY THE COMMON COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF BLOOMINGTON, MONROE COUNTY, INDIANA, THAT: 

SECTION 1. Chapter 15.04 DEFINITIONS shall be amended by adding the following 
definitions in alphabetical order within this Chapter, assigning the following section 
numbers, and renumber the remaining sections accordingly, and listing all sections in the 
table of contents for this Chapter: 

Section 15.04.090 Parking space. "Parking space" means any space that is 
designated for the parking of a single vehicle by lines painted or marked on the 
curb or surface of the street or parking facility or, in the event spaces are not 
marked, a space intended for parking that shall not exceed twenty-two feet in 
length. 

Section 15.04.140 Residential Neighborhood Permit. "Residential Neighborhood 
Permit" means a permit that is issued to persons residing in an area with streets or 
boundaries designated by ordinance of the City Council establishing the area 
wherein vehicles displaying a valid permit shall be allowed to be parked. 

Section 15.04.160 Special Events Parking Permit. "Special Events Parking 
Permit" means a permit that is issued to reserve parking spaces for busses and 
other vehicles which are used for purposes including but not limited to the 
transportation of guests to and from lodging establishments and for the 
transportation of performers and/or their equipment used in association with the 
production or presentation of performances at entertainment venues. 

SECTION 2. Sub-Section 15.04.020 (5) Abandoned vehicle of Bloomington Municipal 
Code Chapter 15.04 "Definitions" shall be amended to read as follows: 

A vehicle that has been removed by an authorized towing service upon request of 
a police officer enforcing a statute or ordinance other than Chapter 15.52, if the 
vehicle once impounded is not claimed or redeemed by the owner or his agent 
within twenty days of its removal; or 

SECTION 3. Sub-Section 15.04.020 (6) Abandoned vehicle of Bloomington Municipal 
Code Chapter 15.04 "Definitions" shall be amended to read as follows: 

A vehicle that is three or more model years old and mechanically inoperable, and 
is left on private property continuously in a location visible from public property 
for more then twenty days. 

SECTION 4. Section 15.04.070 Parked of Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.04 
"Definitions" shall be amended by deleting the defmition and replacing it with the 
following: 

Parked means allowing a motor vehicle to remain stationary on a public way, 
public parking area or street, whether attended or unattended, otherwise than 
temporarily for the purpose of and while actually engaged in loading or unloading 
passengers or freight. 

.. ---.... -~ 



SECTION 5. Section 15.12.010 Schedule A of Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 
15.12 "Stop, Yield and Signalized Intersections" shall be amended to add the following: 

Traffic On 

Hawthorne Drive 

Susie Street 

STOP INTERSECTIONS 

Shall Stop for Traffic on 

Wylie Street 

Thomson Park Drive 

SECTION 6. Section 15.12.020 Schedule C of Bloornington Municipal Code Chapter 
15.12 "Stop, Yield and Signalized Intersections" shall be amended to delete the 
following: 

Traffic On 

Hawthorne Lane 

YIELD INTERSECTIONS 

Shall Yield to Traffic on 

Wylie Street 

SECTION 7. Section 15.32.080 Schedule M of Bloornington Municipal Code Chapter 
15.32 "Parking Controls" shall be amended to delete the following: 

NO PARKING ZONES 

Street From To Side of Time of 
Street Restrict. 

Eleventh Street Adams Street Momoe Street North AnyTime 

Lincoln Street Seventeenth Street Nineteenth Both AnyTime 
Street 

Nineteenth Street Walnut Street 150' East of North AnyTime 
Washington 
Street 

Thirteenth Street FessAvenue 140' East of North AnyTime 
FessAvenue 

SECTION 8. Section 15.32.080 Schedule M of Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 
15.32 "Parking Controls" shall be amended by adding the following to Schedule M: 

NO PARKING ZONES 

Street From To Side of Time of 
Street Restrict. 

Cottage Grove Momoe Street Diamond Street South AnyTime 

Eleventh Street Summit Street Momoe Street North AnyTime 

Lincoln Street Seventeenth Street Nineteenth Street West AnyTime 

Lincoln Street Seventeenth Street 72' North of East AnyTime 
Seventeenth 
Street 

Lincoln Street 351' North of Nineteenth Street East AnyTime 
Seventeenth Street 

Madison Street Sixth Street 1 st Alley North of West 2:00 p.m. to 
Sixth Street 7:00 p.m. on 

Tuesdays 
from June 
through 
September 

Roosevelt Street Fourth Street Fifth Street East/West AnyTime 

Thirteenth Street Fess Avenue 171' East of Fess North AnyTime 
Avenue 

2 



SECTION 9. Section 15.32.090 Limited Parking Zones of Bloomington Municipal Code 
Chapter 15.32 "Parking Controls" shall be amended by adding the following: 

(f) Special Events Parking Permits 
Upon approval of application, the Department of Public Works may issue a 
Special Events Parking Permit which temporarily exempts for specified time 
periods certain vehicles and uses from the parking controls listed elsewhere in this 
section. 

1) Except as otherwise provided in this subsection, such permits are valid 
only for parking spaces with a two (2) hour parking time limit on Walnut 
Street and College Avenue between Second Street and Tenth Street, and 
on Kirkwood Avenue between Indiana A venue and Morton Street. 
2) Applications for such permits shall be submitted to the Department of 
Public Works at least seven (7) days prior to the time that reserved parking 
spaces are needed. 
3. The Department of Public Works shall post notice of the parking space 
reservation at least twenty-four (24) hours in advance of the time the 
reservation shall become effective. 
4) The Special Events Parking Permit may be issued for specific parking 
spaces on Walnut Street, College Avenue and Kirkwood A venue provided 
that such parking is restricted to those spaces with a time limit equal to 
and not less than two (2) hours as listed in Schedule N of this section. 
5) Permitted uses for a Special Events Parking Permit shall include, but 
are not limited to, busses transporting guests to and from lodging 
establishments, and busses and other vehicles used in association with the 
production or presentation of performances at entertainment venues. 
6) A Special Events Parking Permit issued under the authority of this 
section shall exempt permit holders from prohibitions listed in 
Bloomington Municipal Code 15.32.070. 
7) The fee for a Special Events Parking Permit shall be ten dollars ($10) 
per vehicle per day or ten dollars ($10) per vehicle parking space per day 
if the vehicle is to occupy more than one parking space. 

SECTION 10. Section 15.32.090 Schedule N of Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 
15.32 "Parking Controls" shall be amended to delete the following: 

LIMITED PARKING ZONES 

Street From To Side of Limit 
Street 

College Avenue 60' North of Eighth 104' North of West 30 min. (8) 
Street Eighth Street 

College Avenue 104' North of 65' South of Ninth West 2 HI. (8) 
Eighth Street Street 

Fourth Street College Avenue Madison Street South 2 HI. (8) 

Fourth Street 15t Alley East of Madison Street North 2 Hr. (8) 
Madison Street 

Fourth Street Rogers Street 1st Alley W. of North 1 Hr. (2) 
Rogers 

Madison Street Fourth Street Kirkwood Avenue West 2 HI. (8) 

Morton Street Seventh Street 1 st Alley North of East 2 HI. (8) 
Seventh Street 

Morton Street 1 st Alley North of Eighth Street East 2 HI. (3) 
Seventh Street 

Morton Street Entrance to Lot 11 Fifth Space South West 1 Hr. (3) 
(South of City Hall) of entrance to Lot 

11 (South of City 
Hall) 

Morton Street Up to but not Seventh Street West 2 Hr. (8) 
including fifth 
space south of 
entrance to Lot 11 

3 



(South of City Hall) 

Second Street Fess Avenue 100' W. ofFess South 15 Min. (2) 
Avenue 

Seventh Street Madison Street Morton Street South 2 Hr. (2) 

Seventh Street Morton Street Ro gers Street North 2 Hr. (2) 

SECTION 11. Section 15.32.090 Schedule N of Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 
15.32 "Parking Controls" shall be amended to add the following: 

LIMITED P ARKlNG ZONES 

Street From To Side of Limit 
Street 

College Avenue 2nd Space North of 4th Space North of West 30 Min. (8) 
Eighth Street Eighth Street 

College Avenue 4th Space North of Bus Stop South of West 2 Hr. (8) 
Eighth Street Ninth Street 

Dunn Street Third Street Fourth Street East 2 Hr. (2) 

Fourth Street College Avenue Rogers Street South 2 Hr. (8) 

Fourth Street 1 st Alley East of 3rd Space East of North 2 Hr. (8) 
Madison Street the 1 st Alley West 

of Madison Street 
Fourth Street 2nd Space East of the 1 st Space West of North I Hr. (8) 

1 st Alley West of the 1 st Alley West 
Madison Street of Madison Street 

Fourth Street Rogers Street I st Alley West of North 2 Hr. (8) 
Rogers Street 

Grant Street Third Street Fourth Street West 2 Hr. (2) 

Madison Street 85' N. of Third Street Kirkwood Avenue West 2 Hr. (8) 

Morton Street Seventh Street Eighth Street East 2 Hr. (8) 

Morton Street Entrance to Lot 11 Seventh Street West 2 Hr. (8) 
(South of City Hall) 

Seventh Street Madison Street Rogers Street South 2 Hr. (2) 

Seventh Street Morton Street Madison Street South 2 Hr. (8) 

Seventh Street Morton Street B-Line Trail North 2 Hr. (8) 

Seventh Street B-Line Trail Rogers Street North 2 Hr. (2) 

SECTION 12. Section 15.32.100 Schedule 0 shall be amended to delete the following: 

LOADlNG ZONES 

200 Block of North Madison Street from 142' to 186' north of Sixth Street on the east side. 

429 E. Kirkwood Avenue, first space west of Dunn Street on the north side. 

SECTION 13. Section 15.32.100 Schedule 0 shall be amended by inserting the 
following into the Schedule in first numeric, and then alphabetical, order: 

LOADlNG ZONES 

200 Block of North Madison Street as posted on the east side of the street. 

429 E. Kirkwood, first space west of Dunn Street on the north side from the hours of 5 :00 
a.m. to 5 :00 p.m., Monday through Saturday. 
200 Block of West Sixth Street, first space east of Morton Street on the north side from the 
hours of 5 :00 a.m. to 5 :00 p.m., Monday through Saturday. 

4 



SECTION 14. Section 15.32.110 Schedule P shall be amended to add the following: 

Street 

Seventh Street 

From 

WaInut Street 

BUS ZONES 

To Side of Street 

First space East North 
of Walnut Street 

SECTION 15. Section 15.32.150 Schedule S shall be amended to delete the following: 

Lot 1 

Lot 2 

Lot 3 

Lot 5 

Lot 6 

Lot 7 

Lot 9 

Lot 11 

Lot 12 

Lot 13 

Lot 17 

Lot 18 

Lot 19 

(8 spaces )/Walnut Street Parking Garage 

(2 spaces)/4th Street/Washington Street 

(3 spaces )16th StreetlLincoln 

(2 spaces )/Bloomington Police Department 

(10 spaces)/Regester Center Parking Garage 

(4 spaces)/4th Street Parking Garage 

(3 spaces) 

(3 spaces) 

(2 spaces) 

(4 spaces) 

(1 space) 

(3 spaces) 

John F. Kennedy Law Enforcement Building - the first space south of the driveway on the 
west side of Lincoln Street. 

SECTION 16. Section 15.32.150 Schedule S shall be amended to add the following: 

Lot 1 

Lot 2 

Lot 3 

Lot 5 

Lot 6 

Lot 7 

Lot 9 

Lot 11 

Lot 12 

Lot 13 

Lot 17 

Lot 18 

Lot 19 

Lot 20 

Lot21 

Lot 22 

Lot 24 

(3 spaces)/4th & Dunn 

(8 spaces)lWalnut Center Garage (ih & Walnut) 

(4 spaces)/4th & Washington 

(3 spaces)/6th Street &Lincoln 

(2 spaces)l3rd & Washington (BPD) 

(11 spaces)/Regester Parking Garage (7th & Morton) 

(8 spaces)/4th & Walnut Garage 

(4 spaces)/City Employee Lot (Green Lot) 

(5 spaces)/IU Research Park (Red Lot) 

(5 spaces)/CFC (White Lot) 

(2 spaces)/Bryan Park on Woodlawn 

(3 space )lBryan Park on Stull 

(4 spaces )lBryan Park at Henderson & Dixie 

(3 spaces )lHenderson & Allen 

(5 spaces )lBryan Park Pool Area 

(5 spaces)/Southdowns & Woodlawn 

(2 spaces )/Miller Showers Park & 17th 

100 Block of North College - first space north of Eighth Street on the west side of 
College Avenue 

5 



100 Block of North Walnut Street - first space south of Sixth Street on the west side of 
Walnut Street. 
200 Block of South Grant Street - first space south of Fourth Street on the west side. 

City of Bloomington Police Department - first space south of the driveway on the west side 
of Lincoln Street. 

SECTION 17. Section 15.32.170 Parking prohibited facing traffic shall be amended by 
deleting the existing section and replacing it with the following: 

No person shall stand or park a vehicle on the street or roadway other than in the 
direction oflawful traffic movement. Where parallel parking is required, vehicles 
shall park with the curbside wheels of the vehicle parallel with and within one foot 
of the curb or within the marked space. Where angled parking is required, vehicles 
shall be parked with the front wheel nearer the curb touching or within one foot of 
the curb or within the marked space. 

SECTION 18. Section 15.37.050 Fees shall be amended by deleting the word "fifteen" 
and replacing it with "twenty-five". 

SECTION 19. Section 15.37.100 Replacement of Penn it shall be amended by deleting 
the word "five" and replacing it with "ten". 

SECTION 20. Section 15.37.140 Special Exceptions shall be amended by adding the 
sentence "This is not in lieu of a service permit" before the last sentence. 

SECTION 21. Section 15.37.150 Violations shall be amended to delete the word 
"generally" in the first sentence. 

SECTION 22. Section 15.37.150 Violations shall be amended to delete the following: 

However, it shall be a Class F violation, as listed in Section 15.64.010, for a person 
holding a valid residential neighborhood parking permit to use or display the permit on an 
ineligible motor vehicle. It shall also be a Class F violation for a person holding a valid 
residential neighborhood parking permit to use or display the permit on an ineligible 
motor vehicle. 

SECTION 23. Section 15.37.170 Zone 1 fraternities and sororities shall be amended by 
renaming the section, "Zone 1 provisions". 

SECTION 24. Section 15.37.170 Zone 1 provisions shall be amended by naming the 
existing provision subsection (a) and adding the following subsection: 

(b) The board of public works may sell up to ten Zone 1 parking permits annually to the 
staff of Hannony School. 

SECTION 25. Section 15.37.190 All Zone pennits shall be amended by deleting the word 
"twenty-five" and replacing it with "fifty." 

SECTION 26. Chapter15.37 RESIDENTIAL NEIGHBORHOOD PERMIT PARKING 
shall be amended by inserting the Section title, "15.37.240 Zone 10 provisions" to the 
table of contents of Chapter 15.3 7 and by adding the following new section: 

15.37.240 Zone 10 provisions. 
The board of public works may sell up to twenty Zone 10 parking permits annually to the 
staff of Fairview Elementary School to allow parking in the area designated "Fairview 
School Staff Permit Parking." 

SECTION 27. Section 15.38.020 Restrictions shall be amended by deleting the existing 
subsection (b) and replacing it with the following: 

(b) No person shall park in Lot 11 between five a.m. and five p.m., Monday 
through Friday without a Green FT Employee permit. 

6 



SECTION 28. Section 15.38.020 Restrictions shall be amended by adding the following 
subsection (c) and renumbering all subsequent subsections accordingly. 

(c) During farmers' market season the following restriction shall apply to 
parking in Lot II: 
No person shall park between four a.m. to two p.m. on Saturdays with the 
following exception: Registered farmers' market vendors with proper 
authorization from the Parks and Recreation Department, under the direction 
of said department, and at the times and locations within the lot specified by 
that department. This prohibition applies to city employees with an otherwise 
properly authorized and displayed city employee permit. 

SECTION 29. Section 15.38.020 Restrictions shall be amended by deleting the existing 
subsection (a) and replacing it with the following: 

(a) No person shall park between five a.m. and five p.m., Monday thorough Friday in any 
of the spaces described in Schedule T without a properly authorized and displayed City 
employee permit, unless granted proper authorization by the Department of Public 
Works. 

SECTION 30. Section 15.38.020 Restrictions shall be amended by deleting subsection 
(f) and renumbering the remaining subsections accordingly. 

SECTION 31. Section 15.38.030 Violation and penalty shall be amended by deleting 
"Class H" and replacing it with "Class D", and by deleting "Section 15.64.01O(i)" and 
replacing it with "Section 15.64.010(d)". 

SECTION 32. Section 15.40.020 Applicable times and charges shall be amended by 
deleting Schedule V and replacing it with the following: 

Municipal 
Lot 

Lot 2 
Walnut Center 
Garage (7th & 

Walnut) 

Lot 5 
(6th and Lincoln) 

Lot 7 
Regester Parking 

Garage 
(7th and Morton) 

Lot 9 
4th & Walnut 

Parking Garage 

SCHEDULE V - PERMITS 
Nonreserved Nonreserved Reserved space 

permit per month permit per lease per month 
month 

Admission Admission Monday through 
Monday - Friday 7 days per Friday 

6:00 am - 6:00 pm, week 
Sat. & Sun 24 hours per 6:00 a.m. -6:00 

6:00 am - Noon day p.m. 

$ 38.00 $ 64.00 $ 52.00 

$ 38.00 $ 52.00 

$ 38.00 $ 64.00 $ 52.00 

$ 38.00 $ 64.00 $ 52.00 

7 

Reserved 
space lease 
per month 

7 days per 
week 

24 hours per 
day 

$ 69.00 

$ 69.00 

$ 69.00 

$ 69.00 



.~------- ----,--'. 

SECTION 33. Section 15.40.020 Applicable times and charges shall be amended by 
renaming the existing Schedule W, "Schedule X - City Hall Visitor Parking" and by 
inserting a new schedule, titled "Schedule W - Hourly Parking" immediately following 
Schedule V. The new Schedule W shall read as follows: 

Municipal Lot 

Lot 1 
4th and Dnnn 

Lot2 
Walnut Center Garage 

(7th & Walnut) 

Lot 3 
(4th & Washington) 

Lot 5 
(6th and Lincoln) 

Lot 6 
3rd St.IBPD lot 

Lot 7 
Regester Parking Garage 

(7th and Morton) 

Lot 9 
4th & Walnut Parking 

Garage 

SCHEDULE W - HOURLY PARKING 

Parking charge per 
30 minutes 

$0.50 

$0.25 

$0.25 

$0.25 

$0.25 

$0.25 

$0.25 

Applicable times for 
parking charges 

5 :00 a.m. - 5 :00 p.m 
Monday through Friday 

24 hours per day 
7 days per week 

5:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. 
Monday through Friday 

5:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. 
Monday through Friday 

5:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. 
Monday through Friday 

24 hours per day 
7 days per week 

5:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. 
Monday through Friday 

SECTION 34. Section 15.40.020 Applicable times and charges shall be amended to add 
the words "and Schedule W" after "Schedule V" in subsection (a). 

SECTION 35. Section 15.40.020 Applicable times and charges, subsection Cd) shall be 
amended by deleting all references to "five dollars" and replacing these references with 
"ten dollars". 

SECTION 36. Section 15.40.030 Garage and Lot Permits subsection (b) shall be 
amended by deleting it and replacing it with the following: 

Cb) Garage and lot permit fees are specified in Schedule V of this chapter. A 
reserved lease grants parking privileges for a particular parking space in one 
specific municipal lot or garage. A nonreserved parking lease grants parking 
privileges for the times specified in Schedule V within a designated area in a 
specific municipal lot or garage, and that area shall exclude reserved lease spaces 
and meter only spaces. 

SECTION 37. Section 15.40.030 Garage and Lot Permits subsection (c)(l) shall be 
amended by replacing the word "shall" with the word "may" and by inserting the word 
"shall" after the word "but". 

SECTION 38. Section 15.40.030 Garage and Lot Permits shall be amended by deleting 
the existing subsection (i) and renumbering the remaining subsections. 

SECTION 39. Section 15.40.030 Garage and Lot Permits shall be amended by adding 
subsection G): 

G) The City is neither required to sell permits for periods ofless than one month 
nor to rebate fees paid in advance for periods ofless than one month. 

8 



SECTION 40. Section 15.40.030 Garage and Lot Pennits subsection (i) shall be 
amended by replacing the word "duplicate" with the word "replacement" and by deleting 
the phrase "for reserved parking spaces." 

SECTION 41. Chapter 15.48 EMERGENCY REMOVAL AND IMPOUNDMENT OF 
VEHICLES shall be amended by deleting the word "emergency" wherever it appears in 
this Chapter and wherever the title of this Chapter appears in the Bloomington Municipal 
Code. In particular, 

(a) The Title for Chapter 15.48 shall now read CHAPTER 15.48 REMOVAL 
AND IMPOUNDMENT OF VEHICLES; 

(b) The Table of Contents for Title 15 VEHICLES AND TRAFFIC shall be 
amended to reflect the foregoing new title; 

(c) Section 15.48.020 shall be amended to read Section 15.48.020 Removal 
and Impoundment Procedure and this new title shall be reflected in the Table of Contents 
for Chapter 15.48 

SECTION 42. Subsection (a) of Section 15.48.010 General Provisions of Bloomington 
Municipal Code Chapter 15.48 'Removal and Impoundment of Vehicles" shall be 
amended to read as follows: 

(a) Vehicles parked in any of the following circumstances are declared public 
nuisances and shall be subject to removal and impoundment in accordance 
with this Chapter as, well as any fines set by State law or City ordinance: 

SECTION 43. Subsection (a)(1) of Section 15.48.010 General Provisions of Bloomington 
Municipal Code Chapter 15.48 'Removal and Impoundment of Vehicles" shall be 
amended to read as follows: 

(a)(I) Any vehicle located in such a manner as to constitute a hazard or 
impediment to the free movement of pedestrian or vehicular traffic; 

SECTION 44. Subsection (a)(6) of Section 15.48.010 General Provisions of Bloomington 
Municipal Code Chapter 15.48 'Removal and Impoundment of Vehicles" shall be 
amended to read as follows: 

(a)(6) Any vehicle parked in a leased stall in a municipal parking facility 
without displaying the proper pennit for that stall, or any vehicle in violation 
of Section 15.40.0600) of this code; 

SECTION 45. Subsection (a)(9) of Section 15.48.010 General Provisions of 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.48 'Removal and Impoundment of Vehicles" 
shall be amended to read as follows: 

(a)(9) Any vehicle required to be registered under Indiana Code 9-18-2 
which does not have the proper registration or license plates attached; 

SECTION 46. Subsection (a)(10) of Section 15.48.010 General Provisions of 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.48 'Removal and Impoundment of Vehicles" 
shall be amended by deleting it in its entirety and renumbering remaining subsections. 

SECTION 47. Subsection (a)(12) of Section 15.48.010 General provisions of 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.48 'Removal and Impoundment of Vehicles" 
shall be amended by deleting it in its entirety and renumbering remaining subsections. 

SECTION 48. Section 15.48.010 General Provisions of Bloomington Municipal Code 
Chapter 15.48 'Removal and Impoundment of Vehicles" shall be amended by adding 
Sub-Section (a)(14) at the end of the section which shall read as follows: 

(a) (14) Any vehicle parked in a space and at a time that parking is 
prohibited by a posted "No Parking" sign. 

9 

-_ .... __ .... 



SECTION 49. Subsection (a)(5) of Section 15.52.0lD Applicability of Bloomington 
Municipal Code Chapter 15.52 "Abandoned Vehicles" shall be amended by replacing 
the statutory cite "Indiana Code 9-17-12" with "Indiana Code 9-18-12" so that the 
subsection now reads: 

(a)(5) Registered and licensed under Indiana Code 9-18-12 as an antique vehicle. 

SECTION 50. Section 15.52.030 Vehicles in possession of person other than owner of 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.52 "Abandoned Vehicles" shall be amended by 
deleting Subsections (a) through (d) and replacing them with the following paragraph: 

When a police officer discovers a vehicle in the possession of a person other than 
the owner and the person cannot establish hislher right to the possession of that 
vehicle, the police officer shall act in accordance with Indiana Code 9-22-1-5. 

SECTION 51. Subsection (a)(4) of Section 15.52.040(a)(4) Removal of abandoned 
vehicles of Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.52 "Abandoned Vehicles" shall be 
amended by deleting the following phrase ", and if not paid the owner's registration 
privileges will be suspended on that car" so that it shall read as follows: 

(a)(4) That the owner will be held responsible for all costs incidental to the 
removal, storage, and disposal of the vehicle or parts. 

SECTION 52. Subsection (b) of Section 15.52.040 Removal of abandoned vehicles of 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.52 "Abandoned Vehicles" shall deleted and 
replaced with the following: 

(b) If the tagged vehicle or parts are not removed within the seventy-two hour 
period, the police officer shall prepare a written abandoned vehicle report in 
accordance with Indiana Code section 9-22-1-12. 

SECTION 53. Subsection (c) of Section 15.52.040 Removal of abandoned vehicles of 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.52 "Abandoned Vehicles" shall be amended 
by: 

First, deleting the words "one hundred dollars" in the first sentence and replacing 
them with the words "seven hundred and fifty dollars"; and 

Second, deleting the words "an automobile scrapyard" in the first sentence and 
replacing them with the words "a storage yard". 

SECTION 54. Subsection (d) Section 15.52.040 Removal of abandoned vehicles of 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.52 "Abandoned Vehicles" shall be amended by 
deleting the words "one hundred dollars" as it appears in the first sentence and replacing 
them with the words "seven hundred and fifty dollars". 

SECTION 55. Section 15.52.050 Disposal of abandoned vehicles of Bloomington 
Municipal Code Chapter 15.52 "Abandoned Vehicles" shall be deleted in its entirety and 
from the table of content for this Chapter. 

SECTION 56. Subsection (d) of Section 15.64.010 Violations and penalties ofthe 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.64 'Traffic Violation Schedule" shall be 
amended by deleting "$15.00" after "Fine:" and replacing it with "$20.00" and by 
deleting "$30.00" in the same line and replacing it with "$40.00" so that the phrase 
regarding "Fine" shall read as follows: 

Fine: $20, $40 (depending upon when paid) 

SECTION 57. Subsection (d)(l) of Section 15.64.010 Violations and penalties of the 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.64 "Traffic Violation Schedule" shall be 
amended by deleting the word "fifteen" as it appears in the first sentence and replacing it 
with "twenty" and by deleting the word "thirty" as it appears in the second sentence and 
replacing it with "forty" so that the provision now reads: 

10 



(d)(I) The fine for Class D Traffic Violations shall be twenty dollars, if paid 
within seven calendar days. The fine shall automatically increase to forty dollars 
if not paid within seven calendar days. 

SECTION 58. Subsection (d) "Class D Traffic Violations (most parking violations) and 
Subsection (g) " Class F Traffic Violation" of Section 15.64.010 Violations and penalties 
of the Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.64" Traffic Violation Schedule" shall be 
amended in the following manner: 

First, the reference to "15.37.150 - Permit displayed in an ineligible motor 
vehicle (plate non-match)" shall be deleted from Subsection (g); and 

Second, the reference to "15.37.150 - Parking in residential permit area" in 
Subsection (d) shall be amended to read "15.37.150 - Parking in residential 
permit area; Permit displayed in an ineligible motor vehicle (plate non-match)" 

SECTION 59. Subsection (i) "Class H Violations" of Section 15.64.010 Violations and 
penalties of the Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.64"Traffic Violation Schedule" 
by deleting the following line: 

15.38.020 Unauthorized parking in city employee parking lots 

SECTION 60. Subsection (d) of Section 15.64.010 Violations and penalties of the 
Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 15.64 "Traffic Violation Schedule" shall be 
amended by inserting the following in numerical order: 

15.38.020 Unauthorized parking in city employee parking lots 

SECTION 61. Subsection (a) of Section 15.40.050 City Hall Visitor Parking shall be 
amended by replacing all references to "Schedule W" with "Schedule X" throughout this 
subsection. 

SECTION 62. Subsection (1) of Section 15.40.060 Violations shall be amended by 
replacing the reference to "Schedule WOO with "Schedule X." 

SECTION 63. Section 15.12.010 Schedule A of Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 
5.12 "Stop, Yield, and Signalized Intersections" shall be amended by deleting the 
following stop intersection: 

Traffic On 

Allen Street 

STOP INTERSECTIONS 

Shall Stop for Traffic on 

Henderson Street 

SECTION 64. Section 15.12.010 Schedule B of Bloomington Municipal Code Chapter 
5.12 "Stop, Yield, and Signalized Intersections" shall be amended by adding the 
following multi-stop intersection: 

MULTI-STOP INTERSECTIONS 

Henderson and Allen Street 4-Way 

SECTION 65. If any section, sentence or provision of this ordinance, or the application 
thereof to any person or circumstances shall be declared invalid, such invalidity shall not 
affect any of the other sections, sentences, provisions, or applications of this ordinance 
which can be given effect without the invalid provision or application, and to this end the 
provisions of this ordinance are declared to be severable. 

11 



SECTION 66. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage 
by the Common Council of the City of Bloomington, approval of the Mayor, and 
publication in accordance with State law. However, all fines and fees shall not be 
effective until January 1, 2009. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Common Council of the City of Bloomington, MOlioe 
County, Indiana, upon this ./i'fA. day of ,A.j(Jdr;.;::-lJloiG7L ,2008. 

SUSAN SANDBERG, Presi 
Bloomington Common Coun 

ATTEST: 
/J 

lj~M1l?flL 
REG ~ORE, Clerk 
City of Bloomington 

PRESENTED by me to the Mayor of the City of Bloomington, MOlioe County, Indiana, 
upon this !O iAday of A)0'tf&tf~ __ /, 2008. 

RE~lfoo~~ 
City of Bloomington 

SIGNED and APPROVED by me upon this 
2008. 

7"<1.1.- day of J'..hi1£ , 
~~/& ... 

SYNOPSIS 

~ KRUtAN, Mayor 
City/of Bloomington 

This ordinance makes numerous changes to the Bloomington Municipal Code. This 
includes stop intersections, yield intersections, no parking zones, limited parking zones, 
loading zones, bus zones, accessible parking for persons with physical disabilities, 
parking prohibited facing traffic, special exceptions, residential neighborhood permit 
parking, restrictions violations and penalty, applicable times and charges, parking leases, 
city hall visitor parking, general provisions and violations and penalties. 

Notes: 

1: The Common Council accepted a request to withdraw this ordinance on October 1, 
2008 and reintroduced it on October 15, 2008 with revisions affecting Sections 1, 10, 32 
and 64. 

2. On November 5, 2008, the Common Council passed this ordinance after adopting four 
amendments which are briefly noted below: 

Am 01 was sponsored by Councilmember Piedmont-Smith. It converted the 
intersection at Allen and Hendersonfrom a 2-Way to a 4-Way stop. This entailed 
inserting Sections 63 and 64 and renumbering the ordinance sections 
accordingly. 

Am 03 was sponsored by Councilmember Sturbaum. II converted the 2-hour 
parking on the north side of West Fourth Street to a mix of 1-hour, 2-hour, and 
unrestricted parking to meet the various needs in the area. These changes affected 
Section 11. 

Am 05 was submitted by Councilmember Ruff on behalf of the Administration. It 
changed the escalatingfine for a Class D Violation.from $25/$40 to $20/ $40. 
The change affected Sections 56 and 57. 


