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Memorandum

TO: Members of the City of Bloomington Common Council

FROM: Larry Allen, Deputy Mayor
Beth Cate, Corporation Counsel
Jeff Underwood, City Controller

CC: Stephen Lucas, Council Attorney

RE: Resolution 23-23 : Authorization to Sell 220 E. Third Street (Bloomington
Police Headquarters)

DATE: December 13, 2023

Executive Summary

Resolution 23-23 authorizes the City to sell real property located at 220 E. Third Street
(the “Police Building”) and its surrounding parking lot pursuant to Ind. Code 36-1-11. An
estimated $3M in funds from this sale were presented to Council in December of 2022
as part of the overall funding for the public safety capital projects supported by the
issuance of the 2022 Bond Series approved by Council via Ordinance 22-30. The City
has received three offers for the Police Building, all of which exceed the $3M included in
the City’s overall budget for the public safety capital projects. We recommend that the
City Council approve the sale of the Police Building, which will allow the City to
negotiate with GMS Pavilion Properties, LLC, a local developer that we consider to have
provided the highest and best offer.

Background

In June of 2021, a flood significantly damaged the Bloomington Police headquarters on
East Third Street (“Police Building”), and Fire Station #1 on East Fourth Street. The City
made repairs to the Police Building and had to temporarily relocate Fire Station #1
along with Fire administrative leadership to a location in College Square in the
downtown. The flood further revealed the inadequacies of those buildings to serve as
the long-term homes to both Police and Fire.



In 2022, the Administration proposed to the Common Council of the City of Bloomington
(“City Council”), and City Council approved, the issuance of bonds to provide the
primary funding for several public safety capital projects for the Bloomington Police and
Fire Departments. This fulfilled plans included in the Economic Development Local
Income Tax increase that was passed in May of 2022 to finance, among other things,
needed public safety facility improvements. The improvements included purchasing and
renovating the 64,000 square foot Showers West building to house public safety
administration including a new police headquarters, rebuilding Fire Station 1 and
renovating Fire Station 3, and building a new Fire training and storage facility.

City Council approved issuance of the 2022 Bond Series in December 2022, via
Ordinance 22-30. The bonds were sold on December 8, 2022, and produced net
proceeds of $27.1 million, about a million dollars more than conservative projections
included in memos and presentations to City Council supporting the bond issuance. In
January 2023 via Appropriation Ordinance 23-01, City Council appropriated the bond
funds for the projects and approved the purchase of the 64,000 square feet Showers
West, allowing the Administration to move ahead with renovating that space for use as
the new police headquarters and fire administration offices.

When the Administration presented the public safety bond issuance to City Council for
approval, it included plans to sell the current Police Building and anticipated at least $3
million in proceeds from the sale that would help pay for the needed public safety capital
projects in addition to the bond proceeds. The original proposed projects and costs for
which the proceeds would be used, as they were presented to Council, are below:

Original Proposed Projects and Costs in 2022

Item Estimated Notes
Cost
Purchase of CFC $8.75 Agreed purchase price
Showers building million
Renovation of CFC $14.75 Based on two architectural reviews and
Showers building million space needs and facility upgrades
required




Rebuilding Fire Station $5.5 A conservative estimate: probable cost
#1 million* (including inflation) estimates are $5 to 5.4
million
Remodel Fire Station #3 | $2.5 A conservative estimate for major
million* remodeling, with design yet to be detailed.
Construct BFD $2.5 A conservative estimate that includes
training/logistics center million* contingencies and pricing uncertainties.
and storage facility Comparable facilities for BPD cost $2
million

*Reduction in budgeted amounts is because of a reduction in sources upon a verbal commitment to
Council to not budget the use of former CRED funds for the projects.

Since the issuance of bonds in December 2022 and the approval of the purchase of
Showers West in January 2023, a great deal of activity has occurred, and the public
safety projects are currently underway. Construction has begun for downtown Fire
Station #1. Construction bids for the Showers West renovation were opened on
December 11. Planning and design continue for Fire Station #3 and the Fire Logistics
Training Facility. The current projection of sources and uses of funds for the public
safety projects is as follows:

Sources and Uses of Public Safety Projects

Sources:
Bond $27,100,000
Police Building Sale Proceeds $4.,400,000
Fire Insurance Payout $369,927
Total $31,869,927

Project Uses:
Fire Station 1 (Downtown) $5,364,887




Construction $4,534,990
CM Fee $95,235
CM Labor Est. $141,612
Design $547,700
1% Arts $45,350
Showers West $14,687,052
Construction $12,717,800
CM Fee $267,074
CM Labor Est. $775,000
Design $800,000
1% Arts $127,178

Fire Station 3 (N. Woodlawn Ave, IU Campus)

Est. $1,500,000

Fire Training & Logistics

Est. $1,500,000

Purchase of Showers West $8,750,000
Total Fund Sources $31,869,927
Total Project Uses -$31,801,938
Difference $67,989

Sale Process

Consistent with the plans announced and discussed with Council last year and
Council’s approval of the bond issue and purchase of Showers West, the Administration
moved forward this year on selling the Police Building. In accordance with state code,
the Administration obtained two appraisals of the building, determined a minimum bid,
published notice of the minimum bid amount and other terms of sale, designated the
Board of Public Works (“BPW”) to conduct a noticed public hearing on the disposal of
the property and to make a recommendation to the Administration, and noticed the




public hearing for December 8, 2023, at 3 p.m. Through an open Invitation to Quote,
the Administration selected a broker to market the property widely and generate
bids/offers to purchase. Ind. Code 36-1-11, et seq.

As discussed in the Council work session on December 4, the two appraisals for the
property came in at $3.2M and $4.4M. The minimum bid price noticed for the property
was $3.2M. The City received the following three offers:

1. Aptitude Development based in EImwood Park, NJ

a. Purchase Price: $4,850,000

b. Due Diligence Period: 120 days

c. Contingency: Closing will occur 30 days after “final, non-appealable
approval for the development of student housing of at least 475
bedrooms.”

d. Holdover: During approval period prior to closing with an option to extend
maximum of six (6) months upon written notice.

2. GMS-Pavillion Properties, LLC (Steve Hoffman) based in Bloomington, IN
a. Purchase Price: $4,400,000 ($40,000 earnest money)
b. Due Diligence Period: 60 days
c. Contingency: Title commitment, satisfactory due diligence
d. Holdover: 2 years at $420,000 per year. Option to terminate with 6 months
notice after first year (i.e. minimum lease back of 18 months). Lease may
extend beyond two years for 60-day periods at $35,000/month.

3. UP Campus Student Living based in Chicago, IL

Purchase Price: $3,200,000 ($100,000 earnest money)

Due Diligence Period: 45 days

Contingency: Title commitment, satisfactory due diligence

Holdover: 1 year at 10% of closing price (including all closing costs) and
with 2% annual increase if beyond one year.

oo

On December 8, the BPW held a public hearing, reviewed those offers, and (with one
member recusing) made a finding of “no recommendation” to the Administration. The
comments of the two voting members suggested they were reluctant to reach a
recommendation due to (1) the fact that the bid the City’s broker recommended (the
GMS Pavilion Properties, LLC offer) did not specify a final intended use, unlike the two
other bidders who identified student housing as their goal for the property; (2) the
noticed bid period had four days (two business days) remaining, although they
appreciated that it was unlikely any further offers would come in during that time; and
(3) questions raised recently about whether the City may legally sell the Police Building.

The Administration indicated to the BPW that the City’s goal was to further activate the
downtown in ways that would support local business and the local community, and the



broker emphasized that a variety of uses or mixed uses were possible and consistent
with these goals. Moreover, it is common for a developer to refine plans for use of
property as sale negotiations and post-sale development activity proceeds.

Regarding the bid period, the broker indicated that the high level of inquiry regarding the
property had produced the offers above and they anticipated no further offers coming in
between December 8 and December 12. No further offers were received within the bid
period.

Corporation Counsel indicated to the BPW that the Legal Department had reviewed the
City’s ability to sell the property last year and concluded it may do so, and refrained
from offering further details in the public hearing in view of contemporaneous outreach
to, and suggestions of possible legal action by, the Hill family and others. The Legal
Department continues to conclude that the City may lawfully sell the Police Building.
Any further desired activity involving title to the property can and typically would happen
in the normal course of events during the due diligence period included in the sale.

Under Ind. Code 36-1-11-3(c), the Common Council must approve any sale of real
property valued over $50,000. As indicated above, the Police Building appraised above
this value. Accordingly, as the next step in executing plans discussed and approved in
December 2022/January 2023, the Administration is asking the Council to approve the
sale of the Police Building. With that approval, we will pursue negotiations with GMS
Pavilion Properties, LLC, which we believe to have made the highest and best offer for
the following reasons:

e The $4.4M offer amount substantially exceeds the minimum bid and the City’s
original estimated $3M desired for support of the public safety capital projects

e The holdover terms are flexible and favorable to enable a smooth transition for
BPD

e The offer comes from a well-reputed local developer

e The offer is not contingent on prior planning approval, which otherwise would
delay sale for potentially a substantial amount of time

e The developer is considering a range of uses (hotel, condos, etc.) that would
help activate the area economically, provide facilities currently lacking in the area,
and allow for additional beneficial use of the adjacent public park



This. Indenture W itnesseth, That Sol E. Carmicheal and Florence Carmicheal®

his wife of Volusia County, in the State of Florda, Convey and Warrant to Lela E. Smith, of|lr*p ljj-B. E
Monroe County, in the State af Indiana.,-for and in consideration of Ten dollars and other 4 ‘t- | Comp
valuable consideration the receipt whereof .is hereby acknowledged, the .following described jf- vof T
real estate in Monroe County in the State of Indiana, to-witr i ackr
A part of a certain track of land situated in Block Number one hundred j i to-w
two )1G2( in Waterman Addition to the City of Bloomington Indiana, in Monroe County, Bounded
and described as follows to-wit; Beginning at the Southeast corner of Block one Hundred two ]I Town
102) .thence running west.fifty (50) feet,.thence north, one hundred thirty two (132)'fee.t, | j the
thence east,fifty (50) feet, thence south one hundred thirty two (132) feet to the place [ J Road
of beginning,.. r Sect
Subject ;to a certain mortgage the unpaid balance now held by the Mutual!: 5 and
Building and Loan Ass. $261.54 f i feet
Also the 1922 taxes payable in d923 and all subsequent taxes and assess- the
ments thereafter and all street improvement liens now ordered. r Road
e In Witness whereof, the said Sol E. Carmicheal and Florence & Carmicheal
jhis wife, have hereunto set their hands and-seals, this fourth day .of-December 1922. I alsc
Sol E. Carmichael (Seal) J
- Florence G. Carmichael (Seal). J
|Stat.e of Florida, Volusia County, ss;
Before me, the undersigned, a NotaryPublie in and for said Comity and j | Stat
mState, this Fourth day of December,. A.D., 1922, personally appeared the within named Sol E.\
iCarmicheal and Florence G. Carmicheal his wife the grantors in the above conveyance, and & and
Iacfe?_owlegged the same to be their voluntary act and deed, for the -uses and purposes herein Lo, .
menti ned.:
.In Witness Whereof, | have hereunto subscribed my name and affixed my iithe
jofficial seal; A. B. Pralner
My Commission-expires March 11th, 1923- Notary Public fmy- <
' (SEAL) My C
Filed for record .
‘April .23, 1923, at 2 P.M. _ j Fli<
mFelix J. 3rown,Recorder. 1Apr:
IXXXXXHXXKXXHXXHXXKXKXHKXKXKXKXKXKXKXK XXX XXX XKXX KX K -PQOK XXX XX XXX XKXEXXXXXHXXXX XXX XXX XX XX XXX XX XX XXX E:VI*
. J
This Indenture W itnesseth, That Nat U. Hill and Bess V. Hill, his wife; 1
'Philip B. Bill and Sallie Hill, his wife; Hays E. Buskirk and Ruth Buskirk, his wife; Tunie
JE. Buskirk, widow; Mary T. Batman and Ira C. Batman, her husband; lda Wv Dunn and Frank J. : i Brev
jDunn,: her husband; Julia A. Blair and William T. Blair, her husband, Charles B. Waldron, un- / 1E. |
married of Monroe County, in the State of Indiana Convey and Warrant to City of Blodmingtnn, vy’ _Sixi
ja Municipal Corporation of Monroe County, in the State of Indiana for the sum of Fifty four j Real
hundred ($5400.00) dollars and other valuable consideration the following Real Estate in Monroe
[County, in the State of Indiana, towit; Blo<
Lots Number(ll) Eleven, Twelve (12), Thirteen (1 3 )Fourteen (14), .
Fifteen (15'),. and South one half of Lot Number Sixteen (16) in McCullough's Addition to the Assi
City of Bloomington, Indiana.
"Also Lots Number One (1), Five (5), Six (6) ana Seven (7) in Ryors*
Addition to the city of Bloomington, Indiana,.the same being a Sub-division of Parts of and
Seminary Lots Number Seventy three (73) and Seventy four (74) in the city of Bloomington, .
‘Indiana. « St&i
Also Part of Fractional Lot Number Twenty (20) and'Part of Lot Number
Sixteen (16) in McCuIIough s Addition to the city of Bloomington,. Indian.3, described as
follows, to-wit: Beginning at a point on the North line of Fractional Lot Number Twenty ana
;(20), One Hundred Twenty five (125) feet east of the Bast alley line, running North and Irv
South through said Fractional Lot Number Twenty (20), thence east to West line of Lincoln . the
Street, thence South One-Hundred Seventeen and one half (117d) feet, thence West to a pomt R
directly South of the beginning point, thence North to the place of beginning. ; \my
uy
Subject to the fall installment of taxes for year 1921-, payable in faki pil
of 1922. crl
Subject to the taxes for 1922, payable in year'1923- jApr:
Also subject"to abmortgagefof $3164.28 and- interest due thereon, which j : Rev>
Grantee assumes and agrees to pay. | Pel
-1t Is agreed by and between the parties hereto that the principal consid- XXX
oration for the deed, is that the above and foregoing described real estate shall be used
exclusively for a Free Public Park,,for the use of the Citizens of Bloomington, Indiana; and: ;Job:
that the same shall be named and maintained under the name of The Waldron, Hill and Buskirk j of
Park. And it is further provided that should the Grantee herein, or any other body that j huD'
shall hereater assume their duties, fail to maintain said Park as above described and for to-
the use and purpose mentioned, the said real estate herein described shall revert to the 'Tow
Grantors herein, their Administrators, Executors, heirs and.assigns. Beg
‘ In Witness Whereof, the said Grantors have hereunto set their hands and j Sou
seals this 3rd day of January, A.D., 1923* rod
Mary T. Batman (Seal) Julia A. Blair 'Seai hun
Ira C. Batman (Seal) William T. Blair (Seal) (25
Hays H. Buskirk (Seal) Hat U, Bill (Seal)
Ruth Buskirk (Seal) Bess V. Hill (Seal) .
Tunis E. Buskirk (Seal) Philip B. Hill (Seal) his
Ida W. Dunn Seal Sallie Hill (Seal)
Frank J. Dunn ESealg Charles B. Walaron(Seal) Sta

State of Indiana, Monroe County, ss; Before me, the undersigned, a Notary Public in.and for.
said County, and State, this 3rd day of January 1923 personally appeared Nat U. Hill and Bess
V. Hill, his wife, Philip B. Hill and Sallie Hill, his wife, Bays E. Buskirk and Ruth Buskirk,
his wife, Tunie E. Buskirk, widow, Mary T. Batman, and Ira C. Batman, her husband, lda W. Dunn
and Frank J. Dunn, her husband, Julia A. Blair and William T. Blair, her husband and Charles' B.
Waldron, single and acknowledged the execution of the annexed deed.

, W itness my hand and Notarial Seal. 1

Filed for recoro Revenue $2.50 Jarﬂ%st.)(\\ll. BLIJ%HC



[ Alec subject Lo & mortignge of J3164.78 to the Cftd
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THIE INDENTURE WITSESEETY,That Mary T.latsas and Ira C.Zatsan,
H.Buakiri And Ruth Buskfck, his wipsjTumie ML Buskir
Duns, har husbandplulis A.5lair and William T.Blais, her
Fuillip B.Hill and Ballie Hi11, his wifejCrariles 5.Walz
In the Etats of Indiarca ey and Tarremt to GLag of Bl
Corppraticn of Woarce County, Iz the Btate of Imziara, for
Eight Thousard Five He=t snd Forty ene Dellers, The re:-
azinowledged thaefoilewicg described Real Eslete in Egnrss
to-witofure of Practiona) Lot Fumber Twenty
ia HeCullough'e Mdditicon to the City of oo [nrior, Ind i
to-witiiBegicning st & point om the Worth lims of Fracticn
in séia Qity, Ome kundred Twenty five (1R8] feet EBast of L
Sorth and Bouth through esigd Fractionsl Let Suzter Tweniy (200, g
208 kurdred serventeen and one HAAT |1_|.‘.'|‘,- feet, more ar tecn, trermss Feg
Weat 1ine of Lot Number Sixteen(l6) in MeSullough's Additicn in said
Horth slong and with the alley line to the North lirna of Practional Lot
[20], thence Bast on-North 1ine of Fractisral Lot Nuzber Twentr (200 t
beginning.

Subjeat ta the taxea for the year 1527 payebls ir the yesr 1528,
Alpa subject to & mortgage of §3154.29 to the Citlzens Losn apd T
R11 Interest dus thereon, whick grantes sspuro Bnd sgrede to DAy

.o
In witeesawbareof, The sals Grantors have hereurto set thels Facds =pd sealm, Thie
20th day of Mapek, 15S7.

Julis A,Hmi= [ Sy
Fillies T.3iair [Ssal)
Tunie H.Puskirk (Besi)
fds ¥ Dorn Seal)
Erank J.Dusn Eaal)
Fallis Bili Seall

Fhillip B.Hiil

Biats of Indjana,Monros County,estBefore me, tha underm:igned, = Hotary Public im
and for sald Qounty &nd Biate, this 18th day of May, 1827 peroonally Sppefred the
mithin nazeds Mary T.Batsan and Ira O.Beiman, her huobendjBaye B, Bupkith and Buth
Faekirk, his wifejTonis H.Buskirk, widow; Ida ¥,Dunn and Frank T, Dunn, ber husband |
Julis A.Flsir and Willis=—TTElair, her husband jBees ¥.H111, widow; Fhillip B,H111 and
Ballis Mill, his wife;Charles B.Waldron, single who Scknowledped the avpsuticn of
the aoosxed deed,Vith=gps-=y hand mnd a:‘l‘lqnf [TTH1

Jage= W.Elair
Notary faklic
By coamissjon axpires Jam 5, 1530
Benl ]
Filse for resord
Juns,8, 1927 ag § P.M.
Feliz J.Brown,Recacder.

mmm R A I W K O O T T
= Gdmrd lin"eleed.

Besn V.0illl Guardian of Aems J,Hi11 , Elfsaveth B, Hill,Nst U,R111,7r, 804
Hargezret Hill as suck Guirdisp , by erder of thellrcuit Cour: of Monmros Qounty, in
the Biate of Indismns, sntsred in Order book of esid Coutt, on page, comvey 1o Cliy of
Hloomington, Indisns, & Municipel Oorpormilon of Monroe County, in the Seste of Indim s
for the sum of Four hundred Fifty nine (§459,00) Dollars, the following Real Estate
in Nonree Qlunty, In the Stats of Indiana, te-wits

Pct of Femctlonal Lot Number Twenty (20) snd Pert of Lot Sumbar Giztsen (16) in
MaCulleugh's Additicon to theCity of Bloomington, Indispn, deecrited as followm: tos
witiBegioning At & ppint on the North line #f Frasticoal Lot Fasber Twanty (20) in

i sald eity, One hundred Twenty five (125] fest Zast of the Easct Alley lice rumnlng

Farth and Bodih through saild Frasticnal Lot Fumber Twesty (20}, remning thance Seuth
Oos bundred saventess Ard epe DL [117§) fesh, mere or less, thence West Lo LEa
Wapt line of Lot Wombar Bicteen (18] io MsCollough's Additicn i= sais City, thanca
Forth slomg and w th the alley line tc the North Line 8f Fracticmsl Lot Nambe TeRnty
(29}, themce Bast om Sortk lire of Fracticnal Lot Nubber Twanty (20) to  the §

of baginning. L]

Sgtjeat to the taxss for tha 1¥E7; paysble In tha year 1328,
e Loan & Trus: Company, #d=d wll
interest dus tharecn, which grantss ageumes 824 GgTess to pay,

In witneps wharsof the said Bass V Hill Quardism mg aforesiid has hersunts sel hes
bapd and seal this 7 day of May A D", 1937,
Bamm ¥V, NI11 (Beal)

i This deed sxumined and mpproved u:._u My 7, 1938

Esrbart A Rundell, Budge.

!E-‘“Lh ef Infisna,Mznroe County;seiBafore ms, the wmdersianed, = Fotdry Publie in and

| for said County, this Tth i.;y of May A.D., 197 perscnally appeared Beas T.Ii1] Ouardim
| of i‘lluhth B.HiY

Aoos T.H111, 1,82t U Hill; Jr.,ecd Margeret H211, ag suck Guerdian
scimowlidge ‘fhe executicn of the annexed Deed,Fitness =y hard and Sotarial seal.

Jhzes¥.Elais
Holery Pakliz
Ny semmisni ires Ju- &, 1330
Gaal)

iFiles for reserd Jume 8, 1927 at 5 P
rrﬂh 7 Brown,Resordar,




Showers West Winning Bid Packages

Bid Package
Bid Pkg 1: General Trades
Bid Pkg 2: Fire Protection
Bid Pkg 3: Mechanical and Plumbing
Bid Pkg 4: Electrical

Contractor
SCS Construction
Multicraft
HFI
Cassady Electric
Total

Bid Amount
4,623,400
310500
4128000
3655900
12,717,800



Showers West
Bid Package

Contractor Name:

Fox Construction

Force Construction

Building Associates

SCS Construction

Jun§GIause Campbell

TOTAL BASE BID $5,884,600 $7,133,401 $4,797,700 $4,617,000 $6,450,000
Alternate 1 - Generator (Deduct): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternate 2 Omitted Omitted Omitted Omitted Omitted
Alternate 3 - IT Room (Add) $45,600 $31,372 $31,700 $6,400 $30,000
Alternate 4 - Restroom (Deduct) $ (510,400) (520,958) (515,634) (516,600) (512,000)
Alternate 5 - Concealed Sprinkler Heads $ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternate 6 - phenolic-foam ducts and fittings $ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Addendum #1

Addendum #2

Addendum #3




Showers West
Bid Package

Contractor Name:

Multicraft
TOTAL BASE BID | $280,000 | s I | |
Alternate 1 - Generator (Deduct): | No Bid | | | | | |
|aternate2 | [ Omitted || | | | |
|Alternate 3 - IT Room (Add) | | $30,500 [ | ] | |
|Alternate 4 - Restroom (Deduct) $ | | ($500) | | | |
[Atternate 5 - Concealed Sprinkler Heads $ | | No Bid | | | | | |
Alternate 6 - phenolic-foam ducts and fittings $ No Bid

Addendum #1

Addendum #2

Addendum #3




Showers West
Bid Package

Contractor Name:

Heflin HFI HF12 &3

TOTAL BASE BID |  s$4,265000 || $4,125000 ||[$  4,450,000.00 | |
Alternate 1 - Generator (Deduct): | No Bid | | No Bid | | | |
[akternate 2 | | Omitted | | Omitted | | | |
|Alternate 3 - IT Room (Add) | | $3,400 | | $3,000 | | $40,000 | |
|Alternate 4 - Restroom (Deduct) $ | | ($4,000) | | (516,0000 || ? | |
[Atternate 5 - Concealed Sprinkler Heads $ | | No Bid | | $3,000 | | ? | |
Alternate 6 - phenolic-foam ducts and fittings $ No Bid No Bid ?

Addendum #1

Addendum #2

Addendum #3




Showers West
Bid Package

Contractor Name:

Electric Plus Cassady
TOTAL BASE BID |$ 5966,770.00| [$  3,645,900.00 | | ||
Alternate 1 - Generator (Deduct): | $ (469,000.00)| | $ (471,345.00)| | |1
|Auemaze-z | | Omitted | | Omitted | | | |
|Alternate 3 - IT Room (Add) | 1 2,500.00 | | $ 10,000.00 | | |1
|Alternate 4 - Restroom (Deduct) $ | s (1,750.00)| | $ (2,550.00)| | |
|Alternate 5 - Concealed Sprinkler Heads $ | | No Bid | | No Bid | | | |
Alternate 6 - phenolic-foam ducts and fittings $ No Bid No Bid

Addendum #1

Addendum #2

Addendum #3




Showers West
Bid Package

Contractor Name:

Force

Jungclaus Campbell

TOTAL BASE BID | $18,468600 || $16,000,500 || [ |
Alternate 1 - Generator (Deduct): | (s512,148) ||  ($550,000) || [ |
|arernate2 | | Omitted | Omitted | | [ |
|Alternate 3 - IT Room (Add) | | $41,215 | $80,000 | | [ |
[Alternate 4 - Restroom (Deduct) $ | | ($44,747) || ($32,000) || [ |
|atternate 5 - concealed Sprinkler Heads $ | 1 $3,518 I $5,000 || | 1
Alternate 6 - phenolic-foam ducts and fittings $ No Bid No Bid

Addendum #1

Addendum #2

Addendum #3






