D%

RN x

City of Bloomington
Common Council

L_eqgislative Packet - Addendum
Issued on Wednesday, 13 October 2021

Wednesday, 13 October 2021
Special Session
6:30 pm

*Please see the notes on the Agenda addressing public meetings during the public health emergency and possible
alternative committee referral actions by the Council. For a schedule of upcoming meetings of the Council and the City’s
boards and commissions, please consult the City’s Calendar.

401 N. Morton Street Office of the Common Council (ph:) 812.349.3409
PO Box 100 Website: www.bloomington.in.gov/council (f:) 812.349.3570

Bloomington, IN 47404 council@bloomington.in.gov



http://www.bloomington.in.gov/council
mailto:council@bloomington.in.gov
https://bloomington.in.gov/onboard/meetingFiles/download?meetingFile_id=9299
https://calendar.google.com/calendar/embed?src=bloomington.in.gov_35a6qiaiperdn7b1r6v2ksjlig@group.calendar.google.com&ctz=America/New_York

*** Amendment Form ***

Ordinance #: 21-39

Amendment #: 02

Sponsored By: [In need of sponsor] (prepared at the request of HR Department)
Date: October 13, 2021

Proposed Amendment: Additions are shown in bold, deletions are shown in strikethrough

1. Ordinance 21-39 shall be amended by inserting a new Section 1C and renumbering subsequent
sections accordingly. The new Section 1C shall read as follows:

SECTION 1C. Ordinance 20-22 fixed salaries for Officers of the Police and Fire
Departments and shall be amended by revising the paragraph following the Contractual
Salaries table in Section Il A of Ordinance 20-22 to strike “$2,000” and replace it with
“$2,500”.

Synopsis

This amendment was prepared at the request of the Human Resources Department to correct the
twenty years longevity pay, which increased from $100 per year to $125 per year with the most
recent police collective bargaining agreement.

9/29/21 Committee Action: N/A
10/13/21 Special Session Action:  Pending



*** Amendment Form ***

Ordinance #: 21-36

Amendment #: 02

Sponsored By: [In need of sponsor] (prepared at the request of HR Department)
Date: October 13, 2021

Proposed Amendment: Additions are shown in bold, deletions are shown in strikethrough

1. Section Il A of Ordinance 21-36 shall be amended by revising the paragraph following the
Contractual Salaries table to strike “$2,000” and replace it with “$2,500”.

Synopsis

This amendment was prepared at the request of the Human Resources Department to correct the
twenty years longevity pay, which increased from $100 per year to $125 per year with the most
recent police collective bargaining agreement.

9/29/21 Committee Action: N/A
10/13/21 Special Session Action:  Pending



